
75t
THTÃIN
ROSS

Agenda ltem No. 14.

Date:

To:

Staff Report

October 13,201,6

Mayor Hoertkorn and Councilmembers

From: Mark Mills, Fire Chief
Robert Bastianon, Fire inspector
Ruben Martin, Fire lnspector

Subject: lntroduction of Ordinance No. 676 Revision to Chapter 1,4.04 of the Ross Municipal
Code -Adoption the 2016 Ed¡t¡on of the California Fire Code and 20L5 lnternational
Fire Code with certain local amendments and additions and Appendix A of the 2015

lnternational Wildland-Urban lnterface Code

Recommendation
L. That the Town Council of Ross holds a public hearing on the proposed Ordinance No.

676.

2. That the Mayor read the title of the attached Ordinance No. 676 to amend, Chapter
L4.04 of the Ross Municipal Code and adoptthe 20L6 Edition of the California Fire Code

and 2015 lnternational Fire Code with certain local amendments and additions and

Appendix A of the 2015 lnternationalWildland-Urban lnterface Code

3. That the Town Council makes a motion to waive further reading and hold a public
hearing on Ordinance No. 676.

4. That the Town Council schedules a public hearing, second reading, and adoption of the
ordinance at the November 70,20!6 Town Council meeting.

Procedural Note
Typically, the Town Council conducts the public hearing on a proposed ordinance at the time of
introduction and first reading. Government Code Sections 50022.I et SCq. requires a slightly

different procedure for an ordinance that is adopting another code by reference, as is the case

here. When a code is adopted by reference, the public hearing must be scheduled after the first
reading, i.e., at the time of the second reading and adoption. The Council should, however, take
public comment at the first meeting.



Discussion
This item involves consideration of an ordinance, which would amend the Town of Ross

Municipal Code to adopt the 20L6 Edition of the California Fire Code and 2015 lnternational
Fire Code with certain local amendments and additions and Appendix A of the 2015

lnternational Wildland-Urban lnterface Code. This adoption process is required by the Town
Council to stay current with the minimum requirements of the State of California building and

fire standards as determined by the California Building Standards Commission.

Every three years the California Building Standards Commissions publishes model codes such as

the California Fire Code, Building Code, Mechanical Code, Plumbing Code, etc. Once published,

local agencies have L80 days to make additions or amendments based on local conditions. lf no
changes are made during this 180-day window, the model codes become effective. Based on

the L80-day cycle, the Town has untilJanuary L,2OL7 to make local changes.

For the last six code adoption cycles, the Marin County Fire Prevention Officers have met and

cooperatively reviewed the model code. This proposed ordinance represents a cooperative
effort to develop standard ordinance language. While some minor changes occur between
jurisdictions, the end result is a more consistent and cooperative approach to fire safety issues,

making it easier for contractors and developers to work with each jurisdiction.

Summary Text of Ordinance
Other than the new code references, there are no significant changes in the proposed

Ordinance language as compared to the last Ordinance 646 adopted by the Town Council in

2013. The Fire Code is arranged and organized to follow sequential steps that generally occur
during plan review or inspection. The 2015 lnternational Fire Code (lFC), which California
adopts with amendments as the 20L6 California Fire Code, has again been organized into 7
parts. Each part represents a broad subject matter and includes the chapters that logically fit
under the subject matter of each part. The 2015 IFC was organized to allow for future chapters
to be conveniently and logically expanded without requiring a major renumbering. Therefore
this code adoption, as in past adoptions, results in some renumbering.

Proposed changes in Fire Ordinance No. 676 include, but are not limited to:

a Renumbering of some referenced sections to reflect where the sections are found in this
current edition of the fire code.

o Adoption of Appendix A from the 20L5 lnternational Wildland-Urban lnterface Code.

Adoption of Appendix N of the 2016 California Fire Code: Temporary haunted houses,
ghost walks and similar amusement uses; this appendix reinforces standards that are

already enforced throughout Marin County Fire agencies,

o Correct the referenced sections for establishing limits for storage of various hazardous
materials.

a

o Removed additional operating permits already covered in the existing code adoption



o Modified the definition of "Membrane Structure" and "Tent" to include the term
"Umbrella Structure" in order to capture large scale umbrellas that are being installed
around the Town of Ross and the County of Marin. (*This wording will be added to the
code in the 20L8 IFC).

Added the definition of "Umbrella Structure" to both support the addition of the term in
"Membrane Structure" and "Tent".

Added a section to address "Unwarranted Alarm Notification" in order to address the
issue of continued unwarranted alarm responses.

Added definition of "Unwarranted Alarm" to support the addition of the term for
continued unwarranted alarm responses.

Added requirement for "Emergency Preparedness for Hotels, Lodging, and Congregate
Houses" to provide guests access to a telephone to report emergencies.

Added an exception to fire apparatus access road to permit driveways to be reduced L6

feet wide.

Modified the requirement for where sprinklers are required in residential occupancies to
include manufactured homes, mobile homes, and multifamily manufactured homes with
2 or more dwelling units in accordance with Title 25 of the California Code of Regulations.

Modified the requirement of "Commercial Cooking Systems" to include NFPA 96

a

o

a

a

Attachments
o Proposed Ordinance No. 676
o Exhibit "A" Findings of Fact

o Redline Ordinance No. 676



TOWN OF ROSS

ORDINANCE NO. 676
AN ORD¡NANCE OF THE TOWN OF ROSS AMENDING CHAPTER 14.04

OF THE ROSS MUNICIPAL CODE ADOPTING THE 2OL6 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE,

CERTAIN PORTIONS OF THE aOLS INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, AND
APPENDIX A OF THE 2015 INTERNATIONAT WILDI.AND.URBAN INTERFACE CODE,

PRESCRIBING REGUTATIONS GOVERNING CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS TO LIFE

AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE OR EXPLOSION; PROVIDING FOR THE ¡SSUANCE OF

PERMITS FOR HAZARDOUS USES OR OPERATIONS; AND ESTABLISHING A FIRE

PREVENTION BUREAU AND PROVIDING OFFICERS THEREFOR AND DEFINING
THEIR POWERS AND DUTIES

The Town Council of the Town of Ross does ordain as follows:

SECTION 1. Findings.

The Town Council finds that in order to best protect the health, safety and welfare of the
citizens of the Town of Ross, it is appropriate to adopt the 2016 California Fire Code (which
consists of certain portions of the 20L5 edition of the lnternational Fire Code, as amended by
the State of California), the 20L5 ed¡t¡on of the lnternational Fire Code to the extent the same is
not inconsistent with the 2016 California Fire Code, and Appendix A of the 2015 edition of the
lnternational Wildland-Urban lnterface Code, along with certain changes and modifications to
these Codes, which the Town Council is authorized to make by California Health and Safety
Code Sections L7958.7 and L8941.5, and reasonably necessary due to local climatic, geological
or topographical conditions.

Therefore, the Town Council hereby makes the factual findings set forth in "Exhibit A" attached
hereto and incorporated herein by reference, and finds that the amendments made in this
ordinance to the 20L6 California Fire Code are reasonably necessary because of the local
climatic, geological or topographical conditions stated in Exhibit A.

The Town Council further finds that adoption of this Ordinance is exempt from the California
Environmental Quality Act ("CEq¡"¡ under California Code of Regulations, Title 14, Section
1s06L (b)(3).

SECTION 2. Municipal Code Amended:

Chapter 14.04 of theTown of Ross Municipal Code is herebydeleted in its entiretyand replaced
by the following:



1.

SECTION 14.04.010 ADOPTION OF 2016 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

AND APPENDIX A OF THE 2015 INTERNATIONAT WILDLAND URBAN INTERFACE CODE

The Town Council of Ross does hereby adopt, for the purpose of prescribing regulations
governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire or explosion, the following, which
shall be collectively known as the "Town Fire Code":

The 2016 California Fire Code, which consists of certain portions of the 2015 edition of
the lnternational Fire Code as amended by the California Building Standards
Commission, including:
a. Division ll of Chapter L ADMINISTRATION, except Sections L03.2 and 108,
b. Appendix B FIRE FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS,

c. Appendix C FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION,

d. Appendix E HAZARD CATEGORIES,

e. Appendix F HAZARD RANKING,

f. Appendix G CRYOGENIC FLUIDS WEIGHT AND VOLUME EQUIVALENTS, and

8. Appendix H HAZARDOUS MATERIALS MANAGEMENT PLANS AND HAZARDOUS
MATERIALS I NVENTORY STATEM ENTS,

h. Appendix N TEMPORARY HAUNTED HOUSES, GHOST WALKS AND SIMILAR
AMUSEMENT USES

2. The lnternational Fire Code published by the lnternational Fire Code Council, lnc., 2015
Edition hereof and the whole thereof, save and except such portions as are hereinafter
deleted, modified or amended by Section L4.O4.IO0 of this Ordinance.

3. Appendix A of the 2015 edition of the lnternationalWildland-Urban lnterface Code save and
except such portions as are hereinafter deleted, modified or amended by Section L4.04.L00
of this Ordinance.

Each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions, and terms of said Town Fire
Code are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof as if fully set out in this
Ordinance, subject only to the amendments and deletions herein. Not less than one (L) copy of
the Codes and Standards hereby adopted is filed in the office of the Fire Marshal of the Ross

Valley Fire Department and from the date on which this Ordinance shall take effect, and the
provisions thereof shall be controlling within the limits of the Town of Ross.

SECTION T.4.O4.020. ESTABLISHMENT AND DUTIES OF THE FIRE PREVENTION BUREAU

The Town Fire Code shall be enforced by the Fire Prevention Bureau of the Ross Valley Fire
Department and shall be operated under the supervision of the Fire Chief of the Ross Valley Fire
Department.

2



sEcTroN 14.04.030. DEFtNtTtONS

Wherever they appear in the California and lnternational Fire Codes, unless otherwise
provided, the following words shall have the meanings ascribed to them in this section:

(a) Whenever the words "Fire Code" are used they shall mean the Town Fire Code
adopted in Section 14.04.010 of this Ordinance.

(b) Wherever the words "agency having jurisdiction" are used, it shall be held to
mean the Town of Ross.

(c) Wherever the term "counsel" is used, it shall be held to mean the attorney for
the Town of Ross.

(d) Wherever the words "Fire Code Official" are used, they shall be held to mean the
Fire Chief or Fire Marshal of the Ross Valley Fire Department.

SECTION 14.04.040. ESTABLISHMENT OF GEOGRAPHIC LIMITS OF DISTRICTS IN WHICH
STORAGE OF CLASS I and CLASS II LIQUIDS IN OUTSIDE ABOVEGROUND TANKS ¡S PROHIBITED

The geographic limits referred to in Section 5704.2.9.6.1 of the 2016 California Fire Code in

which storage of Class I and Class ll liquids in outside aboveground tanks is prohibited are
amended as follows: Town limits. EXCEPTION: Property owned by the Town when approved by
the Fire Chief.

SECTION 1.4.O4.O4T. ESTABLISHMENT OF GEOGRAPHIC LIMITS OF DISTRICTS IN WHICH
STORAGE OF CIASS I and CLASS II LIQUIDS IN ABOVEGROUND TANKS IS PROHIBITED

The geographic limits referred to in Section 5706.2.4.4. of the 2016 California Fire Code in
which storage of Class I and Class ll liquids in aboveground tanks is prohibited are amended as

follows: Town limits.

SECTION 14.04.050. ESTABLISHMENTS OF GEOGRAPHIC LIMITS IN WHICH STORAGE OF

TIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GASES IS TO BE RESTRICTED

The geographic limits referred to in Section 6LO4.2 of the 2016 California Fire Code, in which
storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted, are amended as follows: Town limits.
EXCEPTION: Property owned by the Town when approved by the Fire Chief.

SECTION 14.04.060. ESTABTISHMENTS OF GEOGRAPHIC LIMITS OF DISTRICTS IN WHICH
STORAGE OF EXPLOSIVES AND BLASTING AGENTS IS TO BE PROHIBITED

3



The geographic limits, in which storage of explosives and blasting agents is prohibited, are as

follows: Town limits.

SECTION L4.04.O7O. ESTABLISHMENT OF THE GEOGRAPHIC LIMITS OF DISTRICTS IN WHICH
THE STORAGE OF COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS IS TO BE PROHIBITED

The geographic limits, in which the storage of compressed natural gas is prohibited, are hereby
established as follows: Town limits.

SECTION 14.04.080. ESTABLISHMENT OF THE GEOGRAPHIC LIM¡TS OF DISTRICTS IN WHICH
THE STORAGE OF STATIONARY TANKS OF FLAMMABLE CRYOGENIC FLUIDS IS TO BE

PROHIBITED

The geographic limits, referred to in Section 5806.2 of the 2016 California Fire Code in which
the storage of flammable cryogenic fluids in stationary containers are prohibited, are hereby
established as follows: Town Limits.

SECTION 14.04.090. ESTABLISHMENT OF THE GEOGRAPHIC LIMITS OF DISTRICTS IN WHICH
THE STORAGE OF HAZARDOUS MATERIALS IS TO BE PROHIBITED OR LIMITED

Îhe geographic limits, in which the storage of hazardous materials is prohibited or limited, are
hereby established as follows: Town limits.

SECTION 14.04.100. AMENDMENTS MADE TO THE 2016 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE,2OL5
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE AND 2015 INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND.URBAN INTERFACE CODE

The 20L6 California Fire Code, the adopted portions of the 2015 lnternational Fire Code, as

applicable, are amended and changed in the following respects:

Section L02.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

102.5 Application of residential code. Where structures are designed and constructed
in accordance with the California Residential Code, the provisions of this code shall
apply as follows:

L. Construction and designed provisions: Provisions of this code pertaining to the
exterior of the structure shall apply including, but not limited to, premises
identificaiion, fire apparatus access and water supplies. Provisions of this code
pertaining to the interior of the structure shall apply when specifically required by
this code including, but not limited to, Section 605.L1 and 903.2 shall apply. Where
interior or exterior systems or devices are installed, construction permits required
by Section 105.7 of this code shall also apply.

4



2. Administrative, operational, and maintenance provisions: all such provisions of this
code shall apply.

Section L02.7.3 is hereby added to Chapter L as follows:

Section tO2.7.3 Nationally Recognized Listed Products. Any installation of products and
equipment due to permits required by this Code shall be Labeled and Listed, as defined
in Section 202.

Section 104.1.1 is hereby added to Chapter L as follows:

Section IO4.!.L Supplemental Rules, Regulations and Standards er+el¡dles. The Fire

Code Official is authorized to make and enforce rules and supplemental regulations and
to develop Fire Protection Standards to carry out the application and intent of this code.

Section t94.t2 is hereby added to Chapter 1 as follows

Section LO4.L2. Damages and expense recovery. The expense of securing any
emergency that is within the responsibility for enforcement of the Fire Chief as given in
Section 1-04 is a charge against the person who caused the emergency. Damages and
expenses incurred by any public agency having jurisdiction or any public agency assisting
the agency having jurisdiction shall constitute a debt of such person and shall be

collectible by the Fire Chief for proper distribution in the same manner as in the case of
an obligation under contract expressed or implied. Expenses as stated above shall
include, but not be limited to, equipment and personnel committed and any payments
required by the public agency to outside business firms requested by the public agency
to secure the emergency, monitor remediation, and clean up.

Section 104.73 is hereby added to Chapter L as follows:

Section LO4.t3. Fire prevention resource sharing. Other enforcement agencies shall
have authority to render necessary assistance in plan review, inspection, code
interpretation, enforcement and other fire prevention services when requested to do
so.

Section 105.6.49 of Chapter f. is hereby amended by adding the following additional
operational permits:

4. Aircraft refueling vehicles. An operational permit is required to operate aircraft
refueling vehicles.

5. Fire Protection Plan.
protection plan.

An operational permit is required to implement a fire

5



6. Radioactive material. An operational permit is required to store or handle at any
installation more than L micro curie (37,000 Becquerel) of radioactive material not
contained in a sealed sources or more that l- millicurie (37,000,000 Becquerel) of
radioactive material in a sealed source or sources, or any amount of radioactive material
for which specific license from the Nuclear Regulatory Commission is required.

Section 105.7.L9 is hereby added to Chapter L as follows:

Section L05,7.19 Vegetation Management Plan. A construction permit is required to
implement a vegetation management plan.

Section L09 of Chapter L is amended by adding section 109.3.5 to read as follows:

Section 109.3.5 Abatement of clearance of brush or vegetative growth from
structures. The executive body is authorized to instruct the Chief to give notice
to the owner of the property upon which conditions regulated by section 304.t.2
of Chapter 3 and section 4907.L of Chapter 49 exists to correct such conditions.
lf the owner fails to correct such conditions, the executive body is authorized to
cause the same to be done and make the expense of such correction a lien upon
the property where such condition exists.

Sections LOg.4 and 109.4.1 of Chapter L are hereby amended to read as follows:

LOg.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter,
repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or directive
of the Fire Code Official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of th¡s
code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than

5500.00 dollars or by imprisonment not exceeding 90 days, or both such fine and
imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served
shall be deemed a separate offense.

LOg.4.I Abatement of violation. ln addition to the imposition of the penalties herein
described, the Fire Code Official is authorized to institute appropriate action to
prevent unlawful construction or to restrain, correct or abate a violation; or to
prevent illegal occupancy of a structure or premises; or to stop an illegal act,
conduct of business or occupancy of a structure on or about any premises.

Section LLL.4 of Chapter f. is hereby amended to read as follows

LI!.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to

6



perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less

than 5500.00 dollars or more than 51,500.00 dollars.

Section 2O2 [C] of Chapter 2 is hereby amended by adding the definition of 'Coverings' as

follows:

Coverings shall mean materials including, but not limited to, gypsum board, paneling,
floor boards, lathe and plaster, wood paneling, brick and mortar, or other materials
attached to rough framing of the building elements. 'Coverings' do not include carpet,
linoleum, tile, wall paper, or other decorative finishes.

Section 202 ltl of Chapter 2 is hereby amended by adding the definition of 'Fire Road' as

follows:

Fire Road. See section 502.t

as-felle,w++

eem¡
ne mere than 50gsq, /ft, (timited in size as determined by,,,) in size; ineerperating a

n size ef drain line; ne

8a+-sen4ffieetrieal serviee (110v); May have a separate er shared

Section 202 [M] of Chapter 2 is hereby amended by adding the definition of 'Membrane
Structure' and shall read as follows:

Membrane Structure shall mean an air-inflated, air-supported, cable or frame-covered
structure as defined bythe California Buitding Code and not otherwise defined as a tent
or umbrella structure. See Chapter 31of the Colifornia Building Code.

Section 202 [S] of Chapter 2 is hereby amended by adding the definitions of 'second unit',
'spark arrestor' and 'substantial remodel' as follows:

Second Unit shall mean a completely separate housekeeping unit with kitchen, sleeping
and bathroom facilities which is a part of, an extension to, or a separate structure on a

site developed with a single-family residence, in excess of the maximum density
designated by the zoning district in which the property is situated or as prescribed
thereby.

Spark Arrestor shall mean a chimney device constructed in a skillful-like manner. The
net free area of a spark arrestor shall not be less than four times the net free area of the
outlet of the chimney. The spark arrestor screen shall have heat and corrosion

7



resistance equivalent to l.2-gauge w¡re, L9-gauge galvanized wire or 24-gauge stainless
steel. Opening shall not permit the passage of spheres having a diameter larger than
L/2 inch and shall not block the passage of spheres having a diameter of less than 3/8
inch.

Substantial Remodel shall mean the renovation of any structure, which combined with
any additions to the structure, affects a floor area which exceeds fifty percent of the
existing floor area of the structure within any 36 month period. When any changes are
made in the building, such as walls, columns, beams or girders, floor or ceiling joists and
coverings, roof rafters, roof diaphragms, foundations, piles or retaining walls or similar
components, the floor area of all rooms affected by such changes shall be included in
computing floor areas for the purposes of applying this definition. This definition does
not apply to the replacement and upgrading of residential roof coverings.

Section 2O2 [Tl of Chapter 2 is hereby amended by adding and/or amending the definition of
'Temporary' and Tent' as follows:

Temporary shall mean any use for a period of less than 90 days, where not otherwise
referenced.

Tent shall mean a structure, enclosure, umbrella structure or shelter with or without
sidewalls or drops, constructed of fabric or pliable material supported by any manner
except by air or the contents that it protects.

Section 202lul of Chapter 2 is hereby amended by adding the definition of 'Umbrella Structure'
as follows:

Umbrella Structure shall mean a structure, enclosure or shelter with or without
sidewalls or drops, constructed of fabric or pliable material supported by a central pole.
(See "Membrane Structure" and "Tent")

Section 302.I is amended by adding the definition of 'Public Storage Facility' as follows:

Public Storage Facility shall mean any business that sells, leases or rents space to the
public that is enclosed, whether it is a building, storage container or similar
configuration.

Section 320 is hereby added to Chapter 3 as follows:

Section 320 Public Storage Facilities

Section 320.L General. Public Storage Facilities shall comply with the provisions of this
section.

8



Section 320.2. Location on Property and Fire Resistance of Exterior. All public storage
facilities shall meet the minimum requirements for setback from property lines or fire
resistive construction as set forth in Table 602 of the 2016 Building Code for Group S,

Division 1 occupancies.

Section 320.3. Fire apparatus access. All public storage facilities shall have fire
apparatus access roads provided in accordance with Section 503.

Section 320.4. Storage of Flammable and Combustible Liquids and Hazardous
Materials. The storage of hazardous materials or flammable or combustible liquids in
public storage facilities is prohibited. Such facilities shall post legible and durable sign(s)
to indicate same in a manner and location(s) as specified by the Fire Code Official. This
section shall apply to new and existing public storage facilities.

Exception: Only those quantities of flammable and combustible liquids necessary for
maintenance of the facility may be stored by the facility management per Chapter 57 of
this code.

Section 4O1.Lt is hereby added to Chapter 4 as follows:

Section 4Ot.1,J Hazardous Occupancies. ln occupancies of a hazardous nature, where
access for fire apparatus is unduly difficult, or where special life and fire safety hazards
exist as determined by standardslpelidles of the Ross Valley Fire Department, that
facility or business management shall be required to develop and implement an
Emergency Response Plan, provide for an onsite Emergency Response Team, Emergency
Liaison Officer, staff training and fire drills in accordance with Sections 405 and 406 and
standards developed by the Ross Valley Fire Department.

Section 4Ot.3.2.L is hereby added to Chapter 4 and shall read as follows:

Section 4OL.3.2.t Unwarranted Alarm Notification. Notification of emergency responders
based on an unwarranted alarm shall be punishable by a fine in accordance with the adopted
fee schedule. ln addition, the responsible party shall be liable for the operational and
administrative costs, incurred from the emergency response or mitigation procedures resulting
from an unwarranted alarm notification.

Section 402.I of Chapter 4 is hereby amended by adding the definition of 'Pre-plans' and
'Unwarranted Alarm' as follows:

Pre-plans shall mean detailed plans of target hazard buildings. These pre-plans include
information on the building's location, occupancy, hazards, fire department connections
and hydrants, building layout, and other pertinent data that would assist the fire
department in case of an emergency.

9



Unwarranted Alarm shall mean the giving, signaling or transition of an alarm
notification to a public fire station or emergency communication center when such
alarm is the result of a defective condition of an alarm system, system servicing testing,
construction activities, ordinary household activities, false alarm or other cause when no
such danger exists.

Section 403.1.1 is hereby added to Chapter 4 as follows:

Section 403.L.1 Pre-plans: When required by the Fire Code Official, pre-plans shall be
developed for target hazard buildings according to the written standards developed by
the agency having jurisdiction.

Section 4O3.LO.L4 is hereby added to Chapter 4 as follows:

Section 403.10.L.4 Emergency Preparedness for Hotels, Lodging and Congregate
Houses. Hotels, lodging and congregate houses shall provide guests with immediate
access to a telephone to report emergencies. The exit diagram shall indicate the location
of the nearest telephone and instruct¡ons to dial9L1.

Section 50L.5 of Chapter 5 is hereby added to read as follows:

Section 501.5 Compliance. Failure to comply with this section upon written or verbal
notice from the Chief shall result in a Ross Valley Fire Department order to cease
operations and desist further operations until such time as adequate access and/or
water for fire protection is provided

Section 502.L of Chapter 5 is hereby amended by adding a definition of 'Fire Road' as follows:

Fire Road shall mean those improved or unimproved roads, public or private, that
provide access for firefighting equipment and personnel to undeveloped areas.

Section 503.1.4 is hereby added to Chapter 5 as follows:

Section 503.L.4 Fire Roads. Fire Roads shall be provided for firefighting equipment,
apparatus and personnel to undeveloped areas of the Town of Ross so as to gain access
to improved, unimproved, and undeveloped areas of the Town of Ross, in a manner
approved by the Fire Code Official. Any vehicle or other obstructions may be towed
away at the owner's expense.

Section 503.1.5 is hereby added to Chapter 5 as follows:

Section 503.1.5 Truck company access. For buildings 3 or more stories or greater than
30 feet (9144mm) in height, approved access roads for ladder truck operations shall be
provided within the necessary operational distances as specified by the Fire Code
Official.

10



Section 503.2.1 of Chapter 5 is amended by adding an exception to read as follows:

EXCEPTION: Driveways serving as fire apparatus access roads serving fewer than 5

structures may reduce the width to l-6 feet.

Section 503.2.6.1 is hereby added to Chapter 5 as follows:

Section 503.2.6.1 Load testing. Bridges, piers, wharfs and other structures used for fire
apparatus access shall be load tested to the original designed capacity when required by
the Chief.

Section 503.4 of Chapter 5 is amended by adding the following sentence:

Any vehicle or other obstruction may be towed away at the owner's expense.

Section 503.4.2 is hereby added to Chapter 5 as follows:

503.4.2 Prohibition of Vehicular Parking on Private Access ways. lf, in the judgment of
the Chief or their designee , it is necessary to prohibit vehicular parking along private
access ways serving existing facilities, buildings, or portions of buildings in order to keep
them clear and unobstructed for fire apparatus access, the Chief or their designee may
issue an Order to the owner, lessee or other person in charge of the premises to paint
the curbs red or install signs or other appropriate notices to the effect that parking is

prohibited by Order of the Fire Department. lt shall thereafter be unlawful for such
owner, lessee or other person in charge of the premises to fail to install or maintain in
good condition, the form of notice so prescribed. When such areas are marked or signed
as provided herein, no person shall park a vehicle adjacent to any such curb or in the
private access way contrary to such markings or signs. Any vehicle so parked in the
private access way may be towed away at the expense of the owner of the vehicle.

Section 503.6.1 is hereby added to Chapter 5 as follows:

503.6.1 W¡dth. All gates shall open fully to provide an unobstructed passage width of
not less than 16 feet or a minimum of two feet wider than the approved net clear
opening of the required all weather roadway or driveway and a minimum net vertical
clearance of 13 feet 6 inches.

Section 503.6.2 is hereby added to Chapter 5 as follows:

Section 503.6.2 Electronic gates. All electronic operated gates shall have installed an
approved key switch override system mounted on a stanchion or wall as approved by
the Chief in accordance with StandardslPeJ-¡eies adopted by the Chief. All electronic or
motorized gates shall incorporate in their design that means for fast, effective manual

11



operation of the gates ¡n the event of power or mechanical failure (i.e., easily removable
hinge pins for separating power linkage from gates; undercut, weakened or frangible
members requiring 40 pounds or less pressure against the gates to cause their failure
and the gates to open). All electrical wiring and components of motorized gates shall be
UL listed and installed in accordance with the National Electric Code.

Section 506.1 of Chapter 5 is hereby amended as follows

Section 506.1 Key Entry Systems. When access to or within a structure or an area is

unduly difficult because of secured openings or where immediate access is necessary for
life-saving or firefighting purposes or in commercial structures that have an automatic
fire sprinkler or fire alarm system installed, the Fire Code Official is authorized to require
a key entry system to be installed in an approved location. The key entry system shall
be of an approved type listed in accordance with ULLO37, and if it is a box, shall contain
keys necessary to gain access as required by the Fire Code Official.

Section 507.5.1 is hereby amended as follows and by deleting the Exception:

Section 507.5.L Where Required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 350 feet from a

hydrant on a fire apparatus access road, as measured by an approved route around the
exterior of the facility or building, on-site fire hydrants and mains shall be provided
where required by the Fire Code Official.

Section 507.5.L.2 is hereby added to Chapter 5 as follows

Section 507.5.1,.2 Hydrant for sprinkler systems. Buildings equipped with sprinkler
systems installed in accordance with Section 903 shall have a fire hydrant within L00
feet (30 m) of the fire department connections.

Exception: the distance shall be permitted to exceed 100 feet (30 m) where
approved by the Fire Code Official.

Section 5O7.5.7 is hereby added to Chapter 5 as follows:

Section 507.5.7 Fire hydrant upgrades. When additions or modifications to structures
are made, the nearest fire hydrant (if a new one is not required) located by the Chief or
his/her designee, shall be upgraded to the minimum standard of one 4 t/2" outlet and
one 2 1.f2" outlet for single family dwellings and the minimum standard of one 4 Lfz"
outlet and two 2 L/2" outlets for commercial structures.

Exceptions:

L lfthe cost of upgrading the fire hydrant exceeds 2% of the cost ofthe project based
on the building permit valuation.

t2



2. One and two family dwellings equipped throughout with an approved automatic
sprinkler system.

Section 605.1L.3 is hereby added to Chapter 6 and shall read as follows:

605.11.3 Required conduit. All wiring that may contain electrical potential when the
alternate service disconnect has been activated, (such as the wiring between the solar
arrays and the DC electrical disconnect on a photovoltaic system) shall be completely
contained in metal conduit.

Section 605.L1.4 is hereby added to Chapter 6 and shall read as follows:

605.LL.4. Disconnect. The electrical service disconnect for the alternative power supply
shall be located within eight feet from the electrical service disconnect on the same or
an adjacent exterior wall. The disconnect shall be accessible to emergency personnel
from the exterior without the use of ladders or other special equipment.

Exception: Micro-inverter or similar technology for solar equipment that de-
energizes the system at the roof panels upon loss of A/C reference leaving no
energized electrical potential inside the structure when the main breaker is

tripped.

Section 605.1L.5 is hereby added to Chapter 6 and shall read as follows:

605.11.5 Warning Sign. The following wording shall be placed on a permanent sign
attached at the main electrical disconnect. The sign shall be red background with white
letters. Minimum size 2-Lf2" X 6" with a minimum 22pt. font. Minimum size example
below.

WARNING:
This building supplied with an alternative power source. Alternate disconnect is:
(descríbe locotíon - on the right, below etc.) of this main disconnect. Both must be used.

Section 605.LL.6 is hereby added to Chapter 6 and shall read as follows:

Section 605.LL.6 Alternative Power Supplies. The use of an electrical power supply
(including but not limited to: photovoltaic, wind, geothermal or fuel fired generators),

13



other than the community's commercial source, shall comply with section 605.1L.1
through 605.11.3 to the extent applicabie.

Section 90L.7 of Chapter 9 is hereby amended by adding the following sentence

This section shall also apply to residential fire sprinkler systems.

Section 903.2 of Chapter 9 is hereby amended as follows:

Section 903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems in new buildings,
structures, occupancies, and facilities, including manufactured homes, mobile homes,
and multifamily manufactured homes with 2 or more dwelling units in accordance with
T¡tle 25 of the California Code of Regulations, shall be provided in the locations
described in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12. Additionally, an automatic fire sprinkler
system shall be installed in all of the following:

L. Every newly constructed building and facility

Exceptions:

a. Free standing Group U Occupancies not more than 1,000 square feet and
provided with exterior wall and opening protection as per Table 6O2 of the 20L6
California Building Code.

b. Agricultural buildings as defined in Appendix C of the 2016 California Building
Code and not exceeding 2,000 square feet, having clear unobstructed side yard of
combustible materials, exceeding 60 feet in all directions and not exceeding 25
feet in height.

2. ln newly created second units.

ln all buildings that have more than fifty percent (50%l floor area added or any
"substantial remodel" as defined in this code, within any 36 month period.
Exceptions may be granted by the Fire Chief when alternate means of
protection are installed as approved by the Fire Code Official.

ln all buildings except R-3 occupancies, in excess of 3,000 sq. ft. that have more
than ten percent (lO%) floor area added within any 36 month period. Exceptions
may be granted by the Fire Chief when alternate means of protection are installed
as approved by the Fire Code Official.

A change in the use of a structure that results in a higher fire or life safety
exposure when the square footage of the area changing use is more than 50% of
the square footage of the building.

3

4

5.

t4



Section 903.3 of Chapter 9 is hereby amended by aclding the following language:

The requirements for fire sprinklers in this code section are not meant to disallow the
provisions for area increase, height increase, or Fire-Resistive substitution if otherwise
allowed by sections 504 and 506 of the 2016 California Building Code. All automatic fire
sprinkler systems shall be installed in accordance with the written standards of the Fire
Code Official and the following:

a. ln all residential buildings required to be sprinkled, any attached garages shall
be sprinkled, and except for one and two family dwellings, in all residential
occupancies the attics shall be sprinkled.

b. ln all existing buildings, where fire sprinklers are required by provisions of this
code, they shall be extended into all unprotected areas of the building.

c. All single family dwellings in excess of 5,000 square feet shall have automatic
fire sprinkler systems designed in accordance with NFPA Standard L3 or 13R and
standards developed by the Chief.

d. All public storage facilities shall have installed an approved automatic fire
sprinkler system. An approved wire mesh or other approved physical barrier shall
be installed 18 inches below the sprinkler head deflector to prevent storage from
being placed to within 18 inches from the bottom of the deflector measured at a

horizontal plane.

Section 903.4 is hereby amended by deleting the following:

Exception #1,2,3

Section 904.L2 is amended to read as follows:

Section 904.L2 Commercial cooking systems. Commercial cooking equipment that produces
grease laden vapors shall be provided with a Type I Hood, in accordance with the California
Mechanical Code, NFPA 96, and an automatic fire extinguishing system that is listed and labeled
for its intended use as follows:

L. Wet chemical extinguishing system, complying with UL 300.
2. Carbon dioxide extinguishing system.
3. Automatic fire sprinkler systems.

All existing dry chemical and wet chemical extinguishing systems shall comply with UL 300

15



Exception: Public school kitchens, without deep-fat fryers, shall be upgraded to a UL 300
compliant system during state-funded modernization projects that are under the jurisdiction of
the Division of the State Architect.

All systems shall be installed in accordance with the California Mechanical Code, NFPA 96,
appropriate adopted standards, their listing and the manufactures' installation instructions.

Exception: Factory-built commercial cooking recirculating systems that are tested, listed,
labeled and installed in accordance with UL 7108 and the California Mechanical Code and NFPA
96.

Section 906.11 is hereby added to Chapter 9 as follows:

Section 906.11 Fire Extinguisher Documentation. The owner and/or operator of every
Group R Division L and R Division 2 occupancy shall annually provide the Chief written
documentation that fire extinguishers are installed and have been serviced as required
by Title 19 California Code of Regulations when such extinguishers are installed in
residential units in lieu of common areas.

Section 907.2 of Chapter 9 is amended to add the following paragraphs:

New Construction: Every new building constructed for non-residential occupancies
greater than 2000 square feet shall have installed therein an approved fire detection
(products of combustion) system in accordance with the standards established by the
National Fire Protection Association. The type of system installed shall be determined
by the Fire Chief.

Existing Construction: Every existing building remodeled for non-residential
occupancies greater than 2000 square feet shall have installed therein an approved fire
detection (products of combustion) system in accordance with the standards
established by the National Fire Protection Association. The type of system installed
shall be determ¡ned by the Fire Chief.

Section 907.2.I1is hereby amended by changing the first sentence of the exception to read as
follows:

EXCEPTION: For group R occupancies other than single family dwellings.

Section 907.8.5.1 is hereby added as follows:

Section 907.8.5.1 Smoke Alarm Documentation. The owner and/or operator of every
Group R Division L, Division 2, Division 3.L, and Division 4 Occupancies shall annually
provide the Fire Code Official with written documentation that the smoke alarms
installed pursuant to the Building Code have been tested and are operational. lf alarms

16



are found to be inoperable or are missing, such alarms shall be repaired or replaced
immediately.

Section 3101.L is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 310L.1 Scope. Tents, umbrella structures, temporary stage canopies and
membrane structures shall comply with this chapter. The provisions of Section 3L03 are
applicable only to temporary tents, umbrella structures, and membrane structures. The
provisions of Section 3104 are applicable to temporary and permanent tents, umbrella
structures, and membrane structures. Other temporary structures shall comply with the
California Building Code.

These building standards govern the use of tents, umbrella structures, awnings or other
fabric enclosures, including membrane (air-supported and air-inflated) structures and
places of assemblage, in or under which 10 or more persons may gather for any lawful
purpose.

Exceptions:
1. Tents, umbrella structures, awnings or other fabric enclosures used to cover

or enclose private swimming pools and similar facilities on the premises of
private one- and two-family dwellings.

2. Tents used to conduct committal services on the grounds of a cemetery.
3. Tents, umbrella structures, awnings or other fabric enclosures erected and

used within a sound stage, or other similar structural enclosure which is

equipped with an overhead automatic sprinkler system.
4. Tensioned membrane roof materials supported by ridged frames or installed

on a mast and cable system provided such structures conform to the
requirements of one of the types of construction as described in these
regulations.

5. Fabric structures which are part of mobile homes, recreational vehicles, or
commercial coaches governed by the provisions of Division L3, Part 2, Health
and Safety Code (Department of Housing and Community Development).

Section 4902, definition of Wildland/Urban lnterface Fire Area, is amended to read as follows:

Wildland/Urban lnterface Fire Area - A geographical area identified by the state as a "Fire
Hazard Severity Zone".in accordance with the Public Resources Code, Sections 420L through
4204, and Government Code, Sections 5LL75 through 51189, or as identified in WUI maps
adopted by the Town Council.

Section 4906.2 paragraph 2 of Chapter 49 is amended as follows:
2. Land designated as a Wildland-Urban lnterface Area by the local enforcing agency
to be at a significant risk from wildfires and lands designated as Very-High Fire Hazard
Severity Zones by cities and other local agencies.

17



Section 4906.4 of Chapter 49 is hereby added to read as follows:

SECTION 4906.4 Vegetation Management Plan

Section 4906.4. General. All new construction and substantial remodels shall prepare a

vegetation management plan (VMP). Not less than two (2) complete plan sets shall be
submitted to the Code Official for review.

Section 4906.4.L Content. The VMP shall include at the minimum

L. A narrative describing specific and applicable contributing factors in the selection and
design of the plan.

2. The Hazard Assessment Matrix.

3. The list of plants to be used and materials consistent with the approved plant list.

4. Two (2) sets of blue prints showing the house, zone, plant type and spacing

Section 4906.4.2 Cost. The cost of vegetation management plan preparation and review
shall be the responsibility of the applicant.

Section 4907.L of Chapter 49 is amended as follows:

Section 4907.I General. Defensible space will be maintained around all buildings and
structures in State Responsibility Area (SRA) as required in Public Resources Code 4290
and "SRA Fire Safe Regulations" California Code of Regulations, Title 14 Division 1.5,
Chapter 7, Subchapter 2, Section 1270.

Buildings and structures within the Wildland-Urban lnterface Area as designated by the
local enforcing agency to be at a significant risk from wildfires and Very-High Fire Hazard
Severity Zones of a local responsibility area (LRA) shall maintain defensible space as

outlined in Government Code 5LI75-5LL89, and any local ordinance or standard
published by the Fire Code Official.

Section 4907 .2 is hereby added to Chapter 49 as follows:

Section 4907.2 Fire Hazard Reduction. Any person who owns, leases, controls or
maintains any building or structure within specific Wildland Urban lnterface areas of the
jurisdiction of the Town of Ross and persons owning, leasing or controlling land adjacent
to such buildings or structures shall comply with the following: cut and remove all
pyrophytic combustible vegetation within 30 feet of structures, up to 150 feet when
topographic or combustible vegetative types necessitate removal as determined by the
Fire Code Official. Remove piles of accumulated dead vegetation on the property. Cut

18



and remove tree limbs that overhang wood decks and roofs. Remove that portion of
any tree which extends within 10 feet of any chimney or stovepipe. Clean any ieaves
and needles from roof and gutters. Cut and remove growth less than 3-inches in
diameter, from the ground up to a maximum height of L0 feet, provided that no crown
shall be raised to a point so as to remove branches from more than the lower one-third
of the tree's total height.

EXCEPTION 1: When approved by the Fire Code Official, single specimens of trees,
ornamental shrubbery or similar plants used as ground covers, provided that they
do not form a means of rapidly transmitting fire from the native growth to any
structu re.

EXCEPTION 2: When approved by the Fire Code Official, grass and other vegetation
located more than 30 feet (9144 mm) from buildings or structures less than L8
inches (457 mm) in height above the ground need not be removed where necessary
to stabilize soil, and prevent erosion.

Section 4907.3 is hereby added to Chapter 49 as follows:

Section 4907.3 Fire Hazard Reduction From Roadways. The Fire Chief or their designee
is authorized to cause areas within L0 feet (3048 mm) on each side of portions of public
streets and highways and private streets which are improved, designed, or ordinarily
used for vehicular traffic to be cleared of flammable vegetation and other combustible
growth. The Fire Chief or their designee is authorized to enter upon private property to
do so in accordance with Section I4.O4.L2O of the Ross Municipal Code.

EXCEPTION: Single specimens of trees, ornamental shrubbery or cultivated ground
cover such as green grass, ivy, succulents or similar plants used as ground covers,
provided that they do not form a means of readily transmitting fire.

Section 4907 .4 is hereby added to Chapter 49 as follows:

Section 4907.4 Nuisance. Failure to comply with the requirements of Section 4907.2
shall be deemed a public nuisance. The Fire Chief or their designee is hereby
authorized to require the abatement of any nuisance condition described in Section
4907.2 or Section 4907.3. Abatement shall be accomplished in accordance with Section
!4.04.120 of the Ross MunicipalCode.

Section 560L.1.3 is amended to delete the following exceptions:

Exception: L,2, and 4 of section 5601.1.3 are hereby deleted

Section AL04.7.2 of Appendix A of the lnternational Wildland-Urban lnterface Code is amended
as follows:

19



Section Ai04.7.2 Permits. The Fire eocie Officiai is authorizeci to stipuiate reasonable
conditions for permits as necessary to reduce the threat of wildfire in a wildland-urban
interface area and improve the capability of controlling such fires. Permits shall not be
issued when public safety would be at risk, as determined by the Fire Code Official.

Section 41.04.11 is hereby added to Appendix A of the lnternational Wildland-Urban lnterface
Code as follows:

Section 4104.L1 - TRACER BULLETS, TRACER CHARGES, ROCKETS AND MODET
AIRCRAFT. Tracer bullets and tracer charges shall not be possessed, fired or caused to
be fired into or across hazardous fire areas. Rockets, model planes, gliders and balloons
powered with an engine, propellant or other feature liable to start or cause a fire shall
not be fired or projected into or across hazardous fire areas.

Section Al04.I2 is hereby added to Appendix A of the lnternational Wildland-Urban lnterface
Code as follows:

Section ALO4.L2 EXPLOSIVES AND BLASTING. Explosives shall not be possessed, kept,
stored, sold, offered for sale, given away, used, discharged, transported or disposed of
within hazardous fire areas except by permit from the Fire Code Official.

Section 4104.13 is hereby added to Appendix A of the lnternational Wildland-Urban lnterface
Code as follows:

Section LO4.L3 APIARIES. Lighted or smoldering materialshall not be used in connection
with smoking bees in or upon hazardous fire areas except by permit from the Fire Code
Official.

SECTION L4.O4.TLO. AUTHORITV TO ARREST AND ISSUE CITATIONS

(a) The Fire Chiel Chief Officers, Fire Marshal, and Fire lnspectors shall have
authority to arrest or to cite any person who violates any provision of this Chapter
involving the Fire Code or the California Building Standards Code regulations relating to
fire and panic safety as adopted by the State Fire Marshal, in the manner provided for
the arrest or release on citation and notice to appear with respect to misdemeanors or
infractions, as prescribed by Chapters 5, 5c and 5d of Title 3, Part 2 of the California
Penal Code, including Section 853.6, or as the same hereafter may be amended.

(b) lt is the intent of the Town Council of the Town of Ross that the immunities
provided in Penal Code Section 8a7(b)(1) be applicable to aforementioned officers and
employees exercising their arrest or citation authority within the course and scope of
their employment pursuant to this Chapter.

20



SECTION L4.04.T2O. N U ISANCE ABATE M ENT.

(a) Any violations of the Town Fire Code shall be deemed a public nuisance.

(b) The owner of any property within the Town has the primary responsibility for
keeping the property free of public nuisances. Tenants and occupants, for the purposes of this
Chapter, shall be deemed to be the agents of the owner.

(c) All entries and inspections shall be done in a lawful and reasonable manner. lf an

owner, lawful occupant, or the respective agent thereof refuses permission to enter and/or
inspect, the Fire Chief of the Ross Valley Fire Department or the duly authorized enforcement
officer (collectively hereinafter, "Fire Chief") may seek an administrative inspection warrant
pursuant to the procedures provided by California Code of Civil Procedure Section t822.50
through L822.59, as may be amended from time to time, or the successor provisions thereto.

(d) Whenever the Fire Chief or their designee believes a public nuisance exists, the
Fire Chief or their designee shall commence abatement proceedings.

(e) The Fire Chief or their designee shall cause a written notice to be issued to abate
such nuisance. Notice requiring the abatement of such nuisance shall be given by mail to the
owner of the property upon which, or in front of which, such nuisance exists, at such owner's
address as shown on the last equalized Assessment Roll of the County of Marin. Such notice
shall contain the following:

1. The street address and Assessor's Parcel Number for the affected property

2. The date of the inspection of the property by the Fire Department during which
such nuisance was discovered.

3. A description of the nuisance and its location on, or in front of, the property.

4. The abatement action which the owner is required to take and a time limit for such
abatement.

5. A statement that if the owner fails to abate such nuisance within the prescribed
time, the Fire Department, or other Town agent, will abate the nuisance.

6. A statement that if the F¡re Department, or other Town agent, is required to abate
the nuisance the cost of such abatement will be assessed as a lien or special assessment
against the property.

7. A statement that the determination of the existence of a nuisance may be appealed
to the Fire Chief within the time limit to abate the nuisance.

2I



(f) Abatement. Should the owner of the affected property (i) fail to abate the
nuisance, anci (ii) fail to appeai the determination of the existence of a nuisance to the Fire
Chief or their designee within the period set forth in the notice requiring abatement, the Fire
Chief or their designee is authorized to perform such abatement and shall keep an accurate
account of the cost of such abatement, including administrative costs.

(g) The Fire Chief or their designee shall mail written notice of the costs of the
abatement to the owner of the affected property who may, within fifteen days of the date of
such mailing, request a hearing by the Fire Chief with respect to such cost. The Fire Chief shall
hold a hearing within thirty (30) days of receiving the request. The Fire Chief may make any
corrections or modifications if it deems the proposed costs to be excessive or incorrect. The
decision of the Fire Chief shall be final.

(h) Assessment of Cost. The cost of such abatement as finally fixed and determined
by the Fire Chief may be recovered in an appropriate civil action, including costs of litigation
and attorneys fees, or may be enforced by a nuisance abatement lien or special assessment
against the parcel of land as more particularly set forth in Government Code Sections 38773.L
and 38773.5, respectively. At least thirty (30) days prior to recordation of the nuisance
abatement lien, or submission of the report to the Tax Collector for collection of this special
assessment, the Fire Chief or their designee shall give notice to the record owner of the
property of the intent to collect abatement, including administrative costs, against the
property. ln addition to any information required by state law, the notice shall include a

summary of costs associated with enforcement of this Ordinance and abatement of the
nuisance.

(i) Emergency Abatement. Notwithstanding any other provisions of this Chapter,
whenever the Fire Chief or their designee determines that any real property or any building,
structure or condition thereon is dangerous or constitutes an immediate threat to public health
or safety, the Fire Chief or their designee shall, without being required to comply with the
procedures of this Section, immediately cause such public nuisance to be abated, provided all
other legal constitutional requirements are complied with.

(j) Remedies are Cumulative. Nothing in this Chapter shall be deemed to prevent
the Town from commencing a civil or criminal proceeding to abate a public nuisance or from
pursuing any other means available to it under provisions of applicable ordinances or state law
to correct hazards, deficiencies or violations of law in real property in addition to or as

alternatives to the proceedings set forth in this Chapter.

sEcTtoN t 4.o4.tgo PENALTT ES

(a) Any violation of the Town Fire Code as adopted herein may be a misdemeanor or
infraction, and subject to the penalties set forth herein.

(1) The first citation, within a l-2-month period, for a violation of the
Town Fire Code shall be treated as an infraction, punishable by a fine of S100.

22



l2l Any subsequent citation within a twelve (L2) month period for any
violation of the Town Fire Code may be either a misdemeanor or an infraction, as

determined by the discretion of the Fire Chief. Misdemeanors shall be subject to
the penalties set forth in Section 109 or L11 Section 14.04.100 as applicable.
lnfractions shall be punishable by the fines specified in California Government
Code Section 36900.

(b) An Administrative Citation and fine may also be imposed in accordance with
Chapter 9.70 of the Ross Municipal Code. The use of Administrative Citation and fine as means
for addressing violations of this code shall be in addition to criminal, civil or other legal or
equitable remedies established by law that may be pursued to address violations of this code
and may be used at the sole discretion of the Town. The amounts of the Administrative
Citation fines are contained in Section 9.70.t20 of the Ross Municipal Code.

(c) The imposition of one penalty for any violation shall not excuse the violation or
permit it to continue and all such persons shall be required to correct or remedy such violations
or defects within a reasonable time. Unless otherwise specified, each day that a violation
occurs or continues after a final notice has been delivered, shall constitute a separate offense.
The application of both criminal and administrative penalties shall not be held to prevent
enforcement or the correction of prohibited conditions.

(d) Nothing contained in Subsections (a) and (b)of this Section shall be construed or
interpreted to prevent the Ross Valley Fire Department from recovering all costs associated
with a Ross Valley Fire Department emergency response as described in Section L04.I2 of the
2016 California Fire Code, as amended.

sEcTf oN t4.o4.1.40. APPEATS

(a) Any person receiving an Administrative Citation may contest the Citation in
accordance with Section 9.70.070 of the Ross Municipal Code.

(b) Any person receiving a bill for Ross Valley Fire Department response costs and
expenses pursuant to Section I04.I2 of the 20L6 California Fire Code, may file within thirty (30)

days after the date of mailing the bill, an administrative appeal against imposition of the
response costs and expenses. The appeal shall be in writing and filed with the Fire Chief, and
shall include a copy of the bill and statement of the grounds for appeal. The Fire Chief shall
conduct an administrative hearing on the appeal, after giving the appellant at least ten (L0)
days'advancewrittennoticeofthetimeandplace of the hearing. Within ten (L0) days after
the hearing the Chief shall give written notice of the decision to the appellant, which decision
shall be final. lf the appeal is denied in part or full, all amounts due shall be paid within thirty
(30) days after the mailing of the notice of the decision of the hearing officer.

23



(c) Whenever the Fire Chief rejects an application or refuses to grant a permit
applied for, or when it is claimed that the provisions of the Code do not apply or that the true
intent and meaning of the Code have been misconstrued or wrongly interpreted, the applicant
may appeal from the decision of the Fire Chief to the Town Council within 10 days from the
date of the decision. The Town Council shall conduct an administrative hearing on appeal, after
giving the appellant at least ten (L0) days' advance written notice of the time and place of the
hearing. Within ten (L0) days after the hearing, the Town Council shall give written notice of
the decision to the appellant, which decision shall be final. The provision of this section shall
not apply to corrective actions for the clearance of brush or vegetative growth from structures
as outlined in various sections of this Code, or to matters for which an appeal is provided
pursuant to Section L4.04.130 (a) or (b) above.

SECTION 14.04.150. FEE AND PENALTY ADJUSTMENTS

The Town Council may, by resolution, revise the fees and penalties established by this
Title 14.04."

SECTION 3. Validity

Except as specifically provided herein, nothing contained in this ordinance shall be deemed to
modify or supersede any prior enactment of the Town Council which addresses the same
subject addressed herein.

lf any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is for any reason held to
be invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portion of this Ordinance.
The Town Council of the Town of Ross hereby declares that it would have adopted the
ordinance and each section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the
fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses or phrases shall be declared
invalid.

sEcTroN 4. Ordinance posting and effective date

Within fifteen (15) days after its adoption, a summary of this Ordinance shall be posted in three
public places in the Town of Ross and a certified copy of the full text of this Ordinance shall be
posted in Town Hall.

This Ordinance shall be effective 30 days following its adoption by the Town Council or January
L,2OI7, whichever is later.

The Town Clerk shall cause Section 2 of this ordinance to be codified in the Ross Municipal
Code.

This Ordinance, together with the findings in Exhibit A, shall be filed with the California Building
Standards Commission within thirty (30) days after its final passage.

24



The foregoing ordinance was duly introduced at a regular meeting of the Town Council of the
Town of Ross held on the 13th day of October 2016 and thereafter adopted at a regular
meeting of the Town Council on the L0th day of November 2016 by the following vote:

AYES:

NOES:

ABSENT:

ABSTAIN:

Kathleen Hoertkorn, Mayor

ATTEST:

Linda Lopez, Town Clerk

25



EXHIBIT A

FINDINGS OF FACT AND NEED

FOR CHANGE OR MODIFICATIONS

TO THE STATE BUILDING STANDARDS

CODE BECAUSE OF LOCAT CONDITIONS

CHANGES OR MODIFICATIONS:

Pursuant to Section L7958.5, 17958.7 and L8941.5 of the State of California Health and Safety Code,

the Town Council of the Town of Ross in its ordinances adopting and amending the 20L6 California

Fire Code, which consists of certain portions of the 20L5 edition of the lnternational Fire Code as

amended by the building standards commission, Appendix A of the 20L5 edition of the lnternational
Wildland-Urban lnterface Code as adopted and amended, changes or modifies certain provisions of
the 20L6 California Building Standards Code (Title 24,Part9) as it pertains to the regulation of buildings

used for human habitation. A copy of the text of such changes or modifications is attached.

Pursuant to Sections 17958.5, t7958.7, and L8941.5 of the State of California Health and Safety Code,

the Town Council of the Town of Ross has determined and finds that the attached changes or
modifications to the 2016 California Building Standards Code are needed and are reasonably necessary

because of local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions.

PROFILE OF THE TOWN OF ROSS:

The Town of Ross encompasses an area of L.6 square miles with a resident population of
approximately 2450. The physical location of the Town is in the central part of Marin County, in the
central portion of the Ross Valley.

The placement of commercial development has been limited to the valley floor area with the
residential communities extending out and up into the steep canyons and hills which surround the
valley on both the north and south sides.

Travel into and out of the area is accomplished through two lane roads, which are the main arteries of
commuter traffic to the bay area commercial centers.

The Town Council recognizes the fact that Marin County has been plagued many times in the late

l-800's and early 1900's by brush and forest fires which not onlythreaten destruction, but on a number
of occasions devastated large portions of communities. The desire of the community to preserve

natural vegetation has resulted in the encroachment of brush and grass on fire roads, trails, breaks

and streets within the Town, thus rendering such separations ineffective against the spread of fires

and safe egress. Natural growth, which is highly flammable during the drier months of the year,

encroaches upon many properties, thus posing a potential fire threat to many structures and creating
a substantial hindrance to the control of such fires.



With the given profile of the Town of Ross and the subsequent research being conducted by members

of the Ross Valley Fire Department staff, the Town has established certain requirements, which were
developed to increase the level of safety and reduce the level of exposure to the citizens of the Town
as well as protect the buildings (investments) within its boundaries. The following points were
established as factors which caused concern and are herein established and submitted as the "Findings

of Fact":

1. CLIMATIC:

a. Precipitation. The normal year's rainfall is approximately 30 to 50 inches on the
averagecalendaryear. Theareahasbeensubjecttoextendedperiodsofdroughtandlessthannormal
rainfall as well as intense rains, which have caused localflooding and damage from geotechnicalfailure
(landslides). Approximately ninety percent (90%) of the annual rainfall during the months of
November through April, and LO%lrom May through October.

b. Relative Humidity. Moisture in the air, also known as relative humidity, changes

significantly during any given day. Humidity generally ranges from 5Oo/o during daytime hours to 85%

at night. lt drops to30% duringthe summer months and occasionally drops lower. During periods

when the area experiences easterly hot, dry winds, the relative humidity drops significantly, thus
creating a greater danger.

c. Temperatures. Average summer highs are in the 75 degree to 85 degree range. There

are weather periods where temperatures can rapidly reach L00 degrees and have been recorded even

higher.

d. Winds. Prevailing winds are generally from the West. However, winds are

experienced from virtually every direction at one time or another, due to topography. Velocities are

generally in the 5 - 15 mph range, gusting to L0 - 30 mph, particularly during the summer months.

Extreme winds, up to 50 mph, have been known to occur.

e. Summary. The climate (weather patterns)within the Town of Ross is predominantly

affected by the marine influence of the Pacific Ocean. During the summer months, the southerly
exposed slopes and open fields become dry with seasonal grasses, which present a fuel for the rapid

spread of fire. The Northerly slopes are heavily wooded and present a moderate to heavy fuel load

with respect to fire danger. These local climactic conditions affect the acceleration, intensity, and size

of fire in the community. Times of little or no rainfall, of low humidity and high temperatures create

extremely hazardous conditions. Furthermore, winds experienced in this area can have a tremendous
impact upon structure fires of buildings in close proximity to one another and wildland areas. All water
storage and supply comes from reservoirs and lakes within the county, and are affected by the climate
accordingly.

-2-



2. GEOGRAPHICAL and TOPOGRAPHICAL:

a. The geographical features in and around the Town of Ross are a source of enjoyment

for our residents. The hills and valleys give a natural beauty to the area with forested hills and golden

yellow meadows leading up to them. These geographic features form the backdrop for the residential

and commercial communities and dictate the locations of roadways and building locations. These

geographic features also create barriers, which negatively affect accessibility and influence fire
behavior during major conflagrations. Many structures (new and old) are constructed of highly

combustible material, which offer little resistance to fire and could contribute to the spread of fire.

For practical and cost reasons, new structures are built of wood (type V) construction. The potential

for conflagration exists with the density of the various specific areas of the Town. The concentrated

commercial, as well as residential occupancies, causes concern when considering the "exposure"

elements of building to building to grass and brush areas of the Town.

b. Seismic Location. The Town of Ross lies within the recognized seismic zone #4, which

is the most dangerous zone. While the area has experienced several significant seismic events, there

has been a minimum of damage. The Town sits between two active earthquake faults (San Andreas

and Hayward) and numerous potentially active faults. The potential for great damage exists, and must

be considered as a real threat to be planned for.

c. Size and Population. The Town of Ross encompasses an area of 1.6 miles with a

resident population of approximately 2450. The Town is served by the Ross Valley Fire Department.

Ross Valley Fire has four (4) stations (two of which are in San Anselmo, one in Fairfax, and one in Ross),

33 fire personnel (serving the Towns of Fairfax, San Anselmo, Ross, and the Sleepy Hollow Fire

Protection District), with diverse responsibilities including wildland, urban, and paramedical.

d. Roads and Streets. Several of the heavily populated areas have limited roadways and

escape routes. The Town of Ross has numerous narrow, winding roads, some barely passable with
modern fire apparatus, causes access problems and extended travel times especially in the older

hillside sections of the jurisdiction. The accessibility for fire department apparatus is of concern due

to the lack of turnouts and roadway widths which increases response time.

e. Topography. The Department's service area is a conglomeration of oak plains, hills,

valleys and ridges. The flatter lands are found in the center portion of the service area and

approximately half of the residential development is in this area. The other half of the service area

with residential development consists of hillsides with slopes ranging from approximately t5-30% and

30+%. These hazardous conditions present an exceptional and continuing fire danger to the residents

of the community due to the difficulty of the terrain and topography of the area, much of it consisting

of boxed canyons with steep, brush covered slopes; narrow winding streets used by residents of the

area and the Fire Department for ingress and egress, steep hills which hinder Fire Department

response time; older and inadequate water systems in certain areas of the community; and the

location of buildings and structures with relation to these dangerous areas. The water supply for
domestic and fire flow systems within this Town are directly affected by the topographical layout of

-3-



the Town. The supply of water comes from lakes, which are managed by a public utilities district
responsible for maintaining an adequate supply. The water distribution system within the Town is

very old in some areas served by mains, which are inadequate in size to provide water for fire
protection. The valley floor is served by mains which contain an exceptionally large volume of water
for fire protection. The Town of Ross has a base elevation of approximately 35 feet and extends to
areas in excess of 900 feet above sea level.

Í. Vegetation. The Town Council recognizes that the Town of Ross has within its
boarders and along its boundaries, significant areas of grass, brush and heavily forested lands. ln

addition, the natural vegetation of the area has been altered by the addition of ornamental trees and

shrubs, which are not native and add fuel around the houses and buildings of our community. The

south facing exposure is primarily annual grasses, highly flammable brush, with occasional clumps of
bay and oak trees in the more sheltered pockets. The north facing slopes are heavily wooded from

lower elevations to ridge with oak and bay trees and minor shrubs of the general chaparral class.

Expansion of the residential community into areas of heavier vegetation has resulted in homes existing

in close proximity to dense natural foliage. Often such dwellings are completely surrounded by highly

combustible vegetation compounding the fire problem from a conflagration point of view. Of
particular recent notice is the increase in dead down fuel and ladder accumulation directly associated

with the sudden oak death syndrome.

g. Summary. The above local geographic and topographic conditions increase the
magnitude, exposure, accessibility problems and fire hazards presented to the Fire Department.

Fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life and damage than the
earthquake itself.

The valley floor has zones recognized by the Federal Emergency Management Agency as flood
zones. During times of intense rainfall, flooding and landslides have occurred which have destroyed

structures and threatened lives. Within the past decade, these events have caused the local

government to declare disasters and seek state and federal assistance.

Some of the existing structures in the commercial areas of the Town lack the required firewall

separation. These structures cause concern to the Fire Department because of the potential for major
conflagration. As these structures are replaced, the exposure potential will be significantly reduced.

Several other variables may tend to intensify an incident, such as, the extent of damage to the
water system; the extent of roadway damage and/or amount of debris blockingthe roadways; climatic

conditions (hot, dry weather with high winds); time of day will influence the amount of traffic on

roadways and could intensifythe risk to life during normal business hours; and the availability of timely
mutual aid or military assistance.

Conclusion: Local climatic, geographic and topographic conditions impact fire prevention efforts, and

the frequency, spread, acceleration, intensity, and size of fire involving buildings in this community.

-4-



Further, they impact potential damage to all structures from earthquake and subsequent fire.

Therefore it is found to be reasonably necessary that the California Fire Code, lnternational Wildland-

Urban lnterface Code, and the State Building Standards Code be changed or modified to mitigate the

effects of the above conditions.

Furthermore, California Health and Safety Code Section L7958.7 require that the modification or

change be expressly marked and identified as to which each finding refers. Therefore, the Town of
Ross finds that the following table provides code sections that have been modified pursuant to Town

of Ross Ordinance No. _ which are building standards as defined in Health and Safety Code Section

L8909, and the associated referenced conditions for modification due to local climatic, geological and

topographical reasons.

SectionNumber: Localclimatic,geologicalandtopographicalconditions

102.5

LO4.L2

LO4,T3

105.6.49

1_05.7.19

202(c\
202(fl

2o2h)
2o2(ml
202 (s)

202(tl
202(ul

302.1

320.1

320.2

320.3

320.4

40L1.1
40L.3.2.1

402.L

403.1.L

403.10.L.4

502.L

s03.1.4

503.1.s

503.2.L

503.2.6.L

503.4

ta,Ib, Le,2a,2b,2d,2e
2c,2g
2c,2d,29
Le,2a,2b,2d,2e,2f
1"e, 2a, 2b, 2d, 2e, 2f , 2g

te,2a,2b,2d,2e,2f
2a,2d,2e,29
te,2a,2b,2d,2e,2f ,29
td,te,2d,2e
Ie,2a,2b,2d,2e,2f
!e,2a,2b,2d,2e,2f
1.e,2a,2b,2d,2e,2f
2b,2d,2e,29
2b,2d,2e,29
2b,2d,2e,29
2b,2d,2e,29
2b,2d,2e,2g
2b,2c,2d,29
2a,2b,2c,2d,2e
2b,2c,2d,29
2b,2c,2d,29
2b,2c,2d,2g
La,Lb,1.c,2d,2e,2f
La, tb, Lc,2d,2e,2f
2a,2d,2e,29
2a,2d,2e,29
2a,2c,2d,2e,29
2a,2d

-5-



s03.4.2

503.6.1

s03.6.2

506.L
507.5.1

507.5.L.2

507.5.7

605.11

90r.7
903.2

903.3

903.4

904.1.2

906.1_1_

907.2

907.2.t1
907.8.5.L

3L0L.L

4906.2

4906.4

4907.L

4907.2

4907.3

560L.1.3

A104.7.2

A104.1L

ALO4.L2

A1.04.13

2a,2d
2a,2d
2a,2d
2a,2d,2e,29
Le, 2a, 2b, 2c, 2d, 2e, 2f , 29

2a,2d,2e,2g
2a,2c,2f
2a,2b,2d,2e,2f
la, lb, te,2a,2b,2d,2e
ta, !b, te,2a,2b,2d,2e
ta, tb, te,2a,2b,2d,2e
La, tb, Le,2a,2b,2d,2e
2c,29
te,2g
2c,2d,29
te,29
te,29
te,2a,2b,2d,2e,2f
La, Ib , Lc, Ld, 1.e, 2a, 2c, 2d, 2e, 2f , 29

ta, tb, tc, td, te,2a,2c,2d,2e,2f ,29
ta, tb, tc, td, Le,2a,2c,2d,2e,2f ,29
ta, tb,Ic, Ld, te,2a,2c,2d,2e,2f ,29
ta, tb, tc, Ld, Le, 2a, 2c, 2d, 2e, 2f , 29

La, tb, Lc, td, Le,2a,2c,2d,2e,2f ,29
La, tb, Lc, td, te,2a,2c,2d,2e,2f ,29
La, tb, Lc, te,2a,2d,2e,2f
La, tb, Lc, Le,2a,2d,2e,2f
La, tb, Lc, Ie, 2a, 2d, 2e, 2f

-6-



TOWN OF ROSS

oRD|NANCE NO.645076
AN ORDINANCE OF THE TOWN OF ROSS AMENDING CHAPTER 14.04

oF THE ROSS MUNtctpAr CODE ADOPT|NG THE ¡e¡320:10 CAUFORNTA F|RE

CODE, CERTAIN PORTIONS OF THE ¡Eg¡2015 INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE, AND
APPENDTX A OF THE ¡efi¡20:15 |NTERNAT|ONAT W|TDLAND-URBAN TNTERFACE

CODE, PRESCRIBING REGUTATIONS GOVERNING CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS TO
LIFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE OR EXPIOSION; PROVID¡NG FOR THE TSSUANCE

OF PERMITS FOR HAZARDOUS USES OR OPERATIONS; AND ESTABLTSHTNG A FtRE

PREVENTION BUREAU AND PROVIDING OFFICERS THEREFOR AND DEFINING

THEIR POWERS AND DUTIES

The Town Council of the Town of Ross does ordain as follows:

SECIION 1, Findings.

The Town Council finds that in order to best protect the health, safety and welfare of the
citizens of the Town of Ross, it is appropriate to adopt the 2e1¿2016 California Fire Code (which
consists of certain portions of the agpaLi!.i¿ edition of the lnternational Fire Code, as amended
by the State of California), the ¡0ç.t2015 edition ofthe lnternational Fire Code to the extent the
same is not ¡nconsistent with the ee1320!6 California Fire Code, and Appendix A of the
WM edition of the lnternational Wildland-Urban lnterface Code, along with certain
changes and modifications to these Codes, which the Town Council is authorized to make by
California Health and Safety Code Sect¡ons 17958J and 18941.5, and reasonably necessary due
to local climatic, geological ortopographical conditions.

Therefore, the Town Council hereby makes the factual findings set forth in "Exhibit A" attached
hereto and incorporated herein by reference, and finds that the amendments made in this
ordinance to the le{3@!$ California Fire Code are reasonably necessary because of the local
climatic, geological or topographical conditions stated in Exhib¡t A.

The Town Council further finds that adoption of this Ordinance is exempt from the California
Environmental Quality Act ("CEQA") under California Code of Regulations, Title 14, Section
1s061 (bx3).

SECTION 2. Municipal Code Amended

Chapter 14.04 of the Town of Ross Municipal Code is hereby deleted ¡n its ent¡rety and replaced
by the following:



gSECTION 14.04.010 ADOPTION OF ¡E¡¡æTO CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, INTERNATIONAL FIRE

CODÉ AND APPENDIX A OF THE ¡E#¡æ!5 INTERNATIONAL WILDLAND URBAN INTERFACE

CODE

The Town Council of Ross does hereby adopt, for the purpose of prescribing regulations
governing conditions hazardous to life and property from fire or explosion, the following, which
shall be collectively known as the 'Town Fire Code":

T The 24t3!Q!€ California Fire Code, which consists of,,certain portions of the 3gpru
edition of the lnternational Fire Code as amended.by the California Building Standards
Commission, including:
a. Division ll of Chapter 1 ADMtNISTRATIeN, except Sections i.03.2 and i.og,

eEC!|.PAi\l€+
e-.þ. Appendix B FIRE FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS,

4.lAppendix C FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUT|ON,

e,gl-Appendix E HAZARD CATEGORI ES,

Lg-Appendix F HAZARD RANKING,
g-.f,_Appendix G CRYOGENIC F[.Uf DS WEIGHT AND:VOLUME EQUTVALENTS, and
gAppendix H HAZARDOUS.VtnrentAlS MANAGEMENT PLANS AND HAZARDOUS

MATERIALS I NVENTORY STATEM ENTS¿

h. åp=p=e=r'.qi,{==N,==TEM9ffiflL A$9==4N.q..flM!t4ß ..
AMUSEMENT USE9

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

2 Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formâtted: Indent: Left: 0"

&
3. AppendixA ofthe 20L5

except such,port¡ons as

edition of the lnternational Wildland-Urban lnterface Code save and
are hereinaftei;deleted, modified or amended by Section L4.O4.LOO

of this

ire
€€C€t

Each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions, and terms of said Town Fire
Code are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof as if fully set out in this
Ordinance,subjectonlytotheamendmentsanddeletionsherein. Notlessthanone(1) copyof
the Codes and Standards hereby adopted is filed in the office of the Fire Marshal of the Ross
Valley Fire Department and from the date on which this Ordinance shall take effect, and the
provisions thereof shall be controlling within the llm¡ts of the Town of Ross.

2

Formatted: Indent: Left: 0.25". No bullets or

Formâtted: Font: +Body



SECTION 14.04.020. ESTABTISHMENT AND DUTIES OF THE FIRE PREVENTION BUREAU

The Town Fire Code shall be enforced by the Fire Prêvention Bureau of the Ross Valley Fire
Department and shall be operated under the supervision of the Fire Chief of the Ross Valley Fire
Department.

sEcTloN 14.04.030. DEF|N|TIONS

Wherever they appear in the California and Fire Codes, unless otherwise
provided, the following words shall have the in this section:

(a) Whenever the words "Fire used they the Town Fire Code
adopted in Section 14.04.010 Ordinance.

(b) Wherever the 3I€þ ll be held to
mean the Town of

(c) Wherever the term " it sha to mean the attorney for
the

re are they shall be held to mean the
Fire al of Valley Fire Department.

LIMITS OF DISTRICTS IN WHICH
IN OUTSIDE ABOVEGROUND TANKS

rs

The 5704.2.9.6.1of the 3013@!g California Fire Code in

(d)

n

which storage
prohibited are a

ll a'nd-€le¡c'{l-liquids in outs¡de aboveground tanks is

Town limits. EXCEPTION: Property owned by the Town
when approved by

sEcTroN t4.04.o4l. NT OF GEOGRAPHIC LIMITS OF DISTRICTS IN WHICH
STORAGE OF CTASS lj!ú CTASS ll Ate{lå5t{lÈUqUtDS tN ABOVEGROUND TANKS tS
PROHIBITED

The geographic limits referred to in sect¡on 5706.2.4.4. of the ¡eit3pþ California Fire Code in
which storage of Class lggþ Class ll and-€;laes-tl{-liquids in aboveground tanks is prohibited are
amended as follows: Town limits,

3



SECTION 14,04.0550. ESTABLISHMENTS OF GEOGRAPHIC TIMITS IN WHICH STORAGE OF
LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GASES IS TO BE RESTRICTED

The geographic limits referred to in Section 6704.2 of the ¿C132010 California Fire Code, in
which storage of liquefied petroleum gas is restricted, are amended as follows: Town limits.
EXCEPTION: Property owned by the Town when approved by the Fire Chief.

SECTION 14.04.0050. ESTABLISHMENTS OF GEOGRAPHIC LIMITS OF DISTRICTS IN WHICH
STORAGE OF EXPLOSIVES AND BTASTING AGENTS IS TO BE PROHIBITED

The geographic limits, in which storage of explosives and',:blasting agents is prohibited, are as
follows: Town limits.

SECTION 74.04.0770. ESTABTISHMENT OF THE GEOGiAPHIC LIM]TS OF DISTRICTS IN WHICH
THE STORAGE OF COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS.IS..TO BE PROHIBITED

The geographic limits, in which the storage of compressed natural gas ¡s prohibited, are hereby
established as follows: Town limits.

SECTION 14,04.080. ESTABTISHMENT OF'THE GEOGRAPHIC LIMITS OF DISTRICTS IN WHICH
THE STORAGE OF STATIONARY TANI$ OF FIAMMABLE CRYOGENIC FLUIDS IS TO BE

PROHIBITED

Tewn iimito,

SECTION 14¡04.090. ESTABTISHMENT OFTHE GEOGRAPHIC TIMITs oF DIsTRIcTs IN WHIcH
THE STORAGEOF HAZARDOU$ MNTENINLS IS TO BE PROHIBITED OR LIMITED

The geographic limitsr.i¡ whichlhe storage of hazardous materials is prohibited or limited, are
hereby established as föllows:,Town limits.

sEcTroN 14.04.100. AMENDMENTS MADE TO THE ¡Cl3æ& CAUFORNTA F|RE CODE,
¡g#la0:!5 TNTERNATTONAL FtRE CODE AND ¡e¡¡20IS tNTERNAT|ONAL WTLDLAND-URBAN
INTERFACE CODE

The 2è132016 California Fire Code, the adopted portions of the :91320!5 lnternational Fire
Code, as applicable, are amended and changed in the following respects:

Section 102.5 ¡s hereby amended to read as follows:

4



L02.5 Application of residential code. Where structures are designed and constructed
in accordance with the california Residential code, the provisions of this code shall
apply as follows:

l-. Construction and designed provisions: Provisions of this code pertaining to the
exterior of the structure shall apply including, but not limited to, premises
identification, fire apparatus access and water supplies. provisions of this code
perta¡ning to the interior of the structure shall apply when specifically required by
this code including, but not limited to, Section 605,11 and 903.2ShAll applv. Where
interior or exterior systems or devices are installed, construction permits required
by Section L05.7 of this code shall also apply.

2. Administrative, operational, and maintenance provisíons: all such provisions of this
code shall apply

Section L02.7 .3 is hereby added to Chapter L as follows

Section 102.7.3 Nationally
equipment due to permits
in Section 202.

ftecggnized listed Products: Any installation of products and
required by this Code shall be Labeled and Listed, as defined

Section 104.1.1 is hereby added to Chapter'l as fòllows;,

Section L04.1.1 Supplemental Rules, Regulations and StandardsËþ&hE_.--Ilr-e-Ítç-_...-.
Code official is authorized to,make and enforce rules and supplemental rãgutäiioni å;id 

-

to develop Fire Protection Standards to carry out the application and intent of this code.

Sect¡on 104:12 is hereby added to Chapter 1 as folloiìvs:

Section 704.t2. Damages and expense recovery. The expense of securing any
emergency that is within the respoñsibility for enforcement of the Fire Chief as given in
section 104 is a charge against the person who caused the emergency. Damages and
expenses incurred by any public agency having jurisdiction or any public agency assisting
the agency hav¡ng jurisdiction shall const¡tute a debt of such person and shall be
collectible by the F¡re Chief for proper distribution in the same manner as in the case of
an obligation under contract expressed or implied. Expenses as stated above shall
include, but not be limited to, equipment and personnel committed and any payments
required by the public agency to outside business firms requested by the public agency
to secure the emergency, mon¡tor remediation, and clean up.

Section 104.13 is hereby added to Chapter 1 as follows:

section L04.13. Fire prevention resource sharing. other enforcement agencies shall
have authority to render necessary ass¡stance in plan review, inspection, code

Formåtted:

5



interpretat¡on, enforcement and other fire prevention services when requested to do
so

Section 105.6.497 of Chapter f. is hereby amended by adding the following additional
operational permits:

4. Aircraft refueling vehicles. An operational permit is required to operate aircraft
ref uel i ng vehicles. Seeg¡epter+

n
e+*€meb¡le-wre€kiÊg-.yer+

ufe€turing+r

7, Firewerk¡, An eperatienal permit is required te etere and use flrewerks fer publie
C¡spþïç

95. Fire Protection Plan. An operational permit is required to implement a fire
protection plan.

*9. Radioact¡ve mAter¡al. An operational permit is required to store or handle at
any installation more than .1 micro cur¡e (37,000 Becquerel) of radioactive material not
contained in a sealed sourqes or mofe that L millicurie (37,000,000 Becquerel) of
radioactive material in a seáled source oasources, or any amount of radioactive material
for,which spec¡fic license from the Nuclear Regulatory Commission is required.

Sect¡on 105.7.19+ is hereby.added to Chapter L as follows:

Section 105.7.197 Vegetat¡on Management Plan. A construction permit is required to
implement a vegetat¡ori;management plan

,tççIisnl=o=?.sf.Ç,r:entçr4j¡,gmg.tdç=q=þy=ed=4ilg¡=ç=c¡jsn199=?,Þ,te.lss=q=ee.f9=[=o.y{ti.

Section 109.3.5 Abatement of clearance of brush or vesetative srowth from
structures. The executive bodv is authorized to instruct the Chief to sive notice
to the owner of the property upon which conditions reeùlated bv section 304.1.2
ofChaoter 3 and section 4907.1 ofChapter4g exists to correct such conditions.
lf the owner fails to correct such conditions. the executive bodv is authorized to
cause the same to be done and make the exoense of such correction a lien upon
the oropertv Where such condition exists.

Sect¡ons 109.4 and I09.4.I of Chapter L are hereby amended to read as follows

Formatted: Font: +Body

6



109.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall
fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter,
repair or do work in violation of the approved construct¡on documents or directive
of the lfire C€ode eQfficial, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this
code, shall be guilty of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than
5500.00 dollars or by imprisonment not exceeding 90 days, or both such fine and
imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served
shall be deemed a separate offense.

t09.4.L Abatement of violation. ln addition tq the imposition of the penalties herein
described, the flire eÇode eQfficial is authorizçd to ¡nstitute appropr¡ate action to
prevent unlawful construct¡on or to restrain, corrêct or abate a violation; or to
prevent illegal occupancy of a structure or premises; or to stop an illegal act,
conduct of business or occupancy of a structure on or about any premises.

Section 1L1.4 of Chapter f. is hereby amended to read as followg:

LLL.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work.order, exçept such work as that person is directed to
perform to remove a violation or unsafe cond¡t¡oh, shall be liable to a fine of not less
than 5500.00 dollars or more than 91,500.00 dollars.

Section 202tcl ofchapier 2 is,hereby amended by addingthe definition of'coverings'as
follows:

Coverings shall mean materials íncluding, þut not limited to, gypsum board, paneling,
floor boards, lathe and plaster, wood panel¡ng, brick and mortar, or other materials
attached to rough frqming ef the building elements. 'Coverings' do not include carpet,
linoleum, tile, wall paper, or ôther decorative finishes.

,Qçç;tjen=?9hJfl.gf ,ÇIsplet=i'¡¡.:trçrç=þl¡==epsnÇçd==Þv=e.ddinçthe=dsfi¡it¡=qn=s!=if ¡rç==Bsq=qi=çs-...
follows:

.Fire Road. See sectíon 502.1.

t
as{ellsrvs+

lun¡e' Sceen+Un¡l a nß reem,

¡ne;#

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

7

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: Level l, Space Before: 0 pt, After: 0 pt,
Tabstops: 0.5",Left+ 1.5",Left+ 2,,,Left+ 2.5",
Left + 3", Left + 3.5", Left + 4',,Left+ 4.5,,, Left +
5",Left+ 5.5",Left + 6",Left

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Strikethrough

Formatted: Strikethrough

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Strikethrough



dsd=þr=s9$ns=t!rç==deJtnitlqn=sf =iMsmþrgr.e.
Structure'and shall read as follows:

Membrane structure, shall mean¡-Ê==eÍ!==qiI-=¡nt[E!çd,=gi=t:iggepf,tçdr==ç?þ!g,gI=.fJf,ng;

covered structure as defined bv the Colífornia Buildlno Code and not otherwise defined
as a tent or umbrella structure, See Chapter 31 ofthe Cofifornlo Bulldrno Code.

Section 202 [S] of Chapter 2 is hereby amended by adding the definitions of'second unit',
'spark arrestor' and 'substantial remodel' as follows:

Second Unit shall mean a completely sqparate housekeeping un¡t w¡th kitchen, sleeping
and bathroom facilities which is a part of, an extension to, or a separate structure on a

site developed with a single-family residence, in .excess of the maximum density
designated by the zoning district in which the property is situated or as prescribed
thereby.

Spark Arrestor shall mean a chi.ùney device constructed in a skillful-like manner. The
net free area of a spark arrestor shall not be less than four times the net free area of the
outlet of the chimney. The spar:k arrestor screen shall have heat and corrosion
res¡stance equivaient to l2-gauge wire, 19-gauge galvanized wire or 24-gauge stainless
steel. Opening:,.shall not permit the passage of spheres having a diameter larger than
1'/2inch and shall not block the passage of spheres having a diameter of less than 3/8
inch.

Sübstantial Remodel"shall mean the renouãtion of any structure, which combined with
any;additions to the structure, affects a floor area which exceeds fifty percent of the
ex¡sting flaor area of ihe structure,within any 36 month period. When any changes are
made in the,building, such as walls, columns, beams or girders, floor or ceiling joists and
coverings, roof rafters, roof diaphragms, foundations, piles or retaining walls or similar
components, the,floor area of all rooms affected by such changes shall be included in
computing floor arieAs for the purposes of applying this definition. This definition does
not apply to the replacement and upgrading of residential roof coverings.

f¡n¡tion of .

'Temporarv' and 'Tent' as follows.:.

Temporarv shall mean anv use for a period of less than 90 davs, where not otherwise
referenced,

Formâtted: Font: +Body

8

Formattedt Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

Formâtted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Hiehlieht

Formatt€d: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

Formatt€d: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: lndent: Left: 0.5", Space Before: 0 pt,
After: 0pt,Tabstops: 1",Left + 1.5",Left + 2",Left
+ 2.5",Left.+ 3",Left+ 3.5",Left+ 4",Left+ 4.5",
Left+ 5",Left+ 5.5,,,Left+ 6",Left

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Hiehlieht

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri). Nor Highlight



Tent shall mean Aa. structure, enclosure, umbrella structure or shelter with or without======:
sidewalls or drops, constructed of fabric or pliable material supported bv anv manner

Section 302.L is amended by adding the def¡nit¡on of 'Public Storage Facility' as follows:

Public Storage Facility shall mean any business that,.sells, leases or rents space to the
public that is enclosed, whether it is a building, storage container or similar
configuration.

Section 32019 is hereby added to Chapter.3 as foilows:

this

Section 320á9 Public Storage Facilities

Sect¡on 3!Q19.L'General..Public Storage Facilities shall comply with the provisions of
section.

Section 3WÐ2. Locatiôn on Property and Fire Resistance of Exterior. All public
storage facilities sþall meêt the minimum requirements for setback from property lines
orlfire resistive construction as set forth in Table 602 of the p!flBuilding Code for
Group S, Division 1 occupancies.

Sect¡on 3¿gJ9.3. F¡re',apparatus access. All public storage facilities shall have fire
apparatus aecèss roadsprovided in accordance with Section 503.

Section 3]f,14.4. Storîge of Flammable and Combustible Liquids and Hazardous
Materials. The storage of hazardous materials or flammable or combustible liquids in
public storage facilities is prohibited. Such facilities shall post legible and durable sign(s)
to indicate same in a manner and location(s) as specified by the Fire Code Official. This
section shall apply to new and existing public storage facilities.

Exception: Only those quantities of flammable and combustible liquids necessary for
maintenance of the facility may be stored by the facility management per Chapter 57 of
this code.

except bv air or the contents that it protectsr

'UmUrella Struct .

âs

Umbrella structure shall mean aÊ==!!f!¡j!!¡=r=9,=S¡glgggfg==g=t==s=trgllg=t=ilh=pt=lyilllgy=t,_

sidewalls or droos, constructed of fabric or pliable matgrial supported bv a central pole.
(See "Membrane Structure" and "Tent"L

Se€t¡en 202 tTI êfCha

9

Formatted: Fontt +Body (Calibri), Not Hiehlieht

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

Formatted¡ Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlieht

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri). Not Highlighr

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not

Formatted: Font:



5€€t¡€+3¿0-¡¡F€'rrr€fke

firewerks is prehibited exeept as permitted by the Fire €ede effieial fer appreved publie
C¡spla1+

utheri¡ed agents shall
in

@¡#erederexpeceC+er seler stered er held in vielatien
ef+h¡s+eCe

Section 40L.t.t is hereby added to Chapter 4 as follows:

Section 40L.t.1, Hazardous Occupancies. ln occupancies of a hazardous nature, where
access for fire apparatus is unduly difficult, or where special life and fire safety hazards
ex¡st as determined by standardslþgEÞ-_gf..t¡_e-_[gss_ yg]lç.y..ïlp.--qçp9l!ll9_!l__t¡g-t-_...
facility or business management shall be required to develop and implement an
Emergency Response Plan, proVide for an onsite Erirergency Response Team, Emergency
Liaison Officer, staff training and.fiie drills in accordance with Sections 405 and 406 and
standards devqloped b!the Ross Valley Fire Department.

Section 401.3.2.1 is herêbv added to Chapter4 and shall read as follows:

section 40x.3.2.x JJnl"vn{rilltg{,,âhtr.,N.q!¡-l=¡=ç?$p.çj==N=g=qfiçg=tj9î,,91==e=mFfgF=î=cJ,I=99p9ndçIå_..-
based on an unwarranted alarm shall be þunlshable bv a fine in accordance with the adopted
fee schedVle. ln additíqn. the resoonsible oartv shall be liable for the operational and
administrative costs, incuired from thê emergencv response or mitigation procedures resultinq
from an unwîrianted alarm noJ¡ficatioh,

Section 4O2J, of Chapter 4 is hereby amended by adding the definition of 'pre-plans' and
'Unwarranted Alarm' as follows:'

Pre-plans shall mean detailed plans of target hazard buildings. These pre-plans include
information on the building's location, occupancy, hazards, fire department connections
and hydrants, building layout, and other pertinent data that would assist the fire
department in case of an emergency.

,Vx!ry,efrixlçd===4i=r.p.=r,hsJ!, sn=.ElEra_..
notif¡cation to a þublic fire station or emergencv communication center when such
alarm is the result of a defective condition of an alarm svstem, svstem servicins testins,

Formâtted: Strikethrough

Formatted: Font: Bold

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

10



construction activities. ordinarv household activities. false alarm or other cause when no
such danger exists,

Section 4093.1.1 is hereby added to Chapter 4 as follows

Sect¡on 4038.1.1. Pre-plans: When required by the {Eire eÇode eQfficial, pre-plans shallr-----
be developed for target hazard buildings according to the written standards developed
bV the authe+içasenghaving jurisdiction.

Section 403.10.1.¿t8Æ'4 is hereby added to Chapter,4as follows:. +--

Section 403.10;t48+4 Emergency Preparedness for Hotels, Lodging and Congregate
Houses. Hotels, lodging and congregate houses shall provide gqests w¡th immediate
access to a telephone to report emergencies. The exit:diagram shall indicate the location
ofthe nearest telephone and instructions to diál gtl.

Section 50L.!4 of Chapter 5 is hereby
+eile+¡¡ng{€nt€å€€=

section so1's Sg!T=9!i?nçg',.fl!',t9 !9-ç9nply-w!!tr..tht:.:-ç91!9t.-qp-qt--wriïçt 9.t.yç-tþ.sl-..
notice from the Chief shall result in a Ross Valley Fire oepartment order to cease
operations and,desist further operations until such time as adequate access and/or
water for fire protection is provided.

Section 502:1 of Chapter 5 is hereby amendèd by adding a definition of 'Fire Road' as follows:

Fire Road shall meán those improved or unimproved roads, public or private, that
provide,access for firefighting equ¡pment and personnel to undeveloped areas.

Section 503.L.4 is hereby added to Chapter 5 as follows:

Section 503.1.4 Fire Roads. Fire Roads shall be provided for firefighting equipment,
apparatus and personnel to undeveloped areas ofthe Town of Ross so as to gain access
to improved, unimproved, and undeveloped areas of the Town of Ross, in a manner
approved by the Fire Code Official. Any vehicle or other obstructions may be towed
away at the owner's expense.

Section 503.1.5 is hereby added to Chapter 5 as follows:

section 503.1.5 Truck company access, For buildings 3 or more stories or greater than
30 feet (fg6+gn+gt¿¿rn¡O) in height, approved access roads for ladder truck

Formâtted: lndent: Left: 0", First line: 0"

Formâtted: Space Before: l2

Formåtted: Font: Bold

TL



operations shall be provided within the necessary operational distances as specified by
the Fire Code Official.

Sect¡on 503.2.1 of Chapter 5 is amended by adding an exception to read as follows:

EXCEPTION: Driveways serving as fire apparatus access roads serving fewer than 5
structures may reduce the width to 1.?16 feet+lth#e€t{åecld€f5.

Section 503.2.6.1 is hereby added to Chapter 5 as follows:

Section 503.2,6.1 Load testing. Bridges,
for fire apparatus access shall be load
required by the Chief.

rfs4gþ!@l¡gglg¡ used
nal designed capacity when

Section 503.4 of Chapter 5 is amended by following

Any vehicle or other obstruction may be

Section 503.4.2 is hereby added to as fol

503.4.2 -Prohibition of Vehicu ways. lf, in the judgment of
the r parking along private
access ways facil buildings in order to keep
them clear for chief-_oglhgi1desirce
may issue an other person in charge of the premises to
pa¡nt ropriate notices to the effect that parking

¡n

It shall thereafter be unlawful for such
premises to fail to install or maintain in

so When such areas are marked or signed
I park a vehicle adjacent to any such curb or in the

to markings or signs. Any vehicle so parked in the
private away at the expense of the owner of the vehicle.

Section 503.6.1 is Chapter 5 as follows:

s03.6.1W¡dth. Aft shall open fully to provide an unobstructed passage width of
not less than 16 feet or a minimum of two feet wider than the approved net clear
opening of the required all weather roadway or driveway and a minimum net vertical
clearance of 13 feet 6 inches.

Section 503.6.2 is hereby added to Chapter 5 as follows:

Sect¡on 503.6.2 Electronic gates. All electronic operated gates shall have installed an
approved key switch override system mounted on a stanchlon or wall as approved by

a

Formatted: Not

condition,
herein,

way
way

L2



the Chief in accordance with Standardsllsl€þs adopte_d_by_the--Çf'jel.-ê!l_ç!ç_c_t_lg-rliç gr-...-- Formatted: Strikethrough
motorized gates shall ¡ncorporate in their design that means for fast, effective manual
operation of the gates in the event of power or mechanical failure (i.e., easily removable
hinge pins for separating power linkage from gates; undercut, weakened or frangible
members requiring 40 pounds or less pressure against the gates to cause their failure
and the gates to open). All electrical wiring and components of motorized gates shall be
UL listed and installed in accordance with the National Electric Code.

Section 506.1 of Chapter 5 is hereby amended as follows:

Section 506.L Key Entry Systems. When access to or,within a structure or an area is

unduly difficult because of secured openings or where immediate access is necessary for
life-saving or firefighting purposes or in commerc¡al structures that have an automãtic
fire sprinkler or fire alarm system installed; tþ Fire Code Official is authorized to require
a key entry system to be installed in an approved location. The key entry system shall
be of an approved type listed in accordance with U11037, and if it is a box, shall contain
keys necessary to ga¡n access as required by the Fire Code Official.

Section 507.5.1 is hereby amended ãs follows and by deleting the Exception:

Section 507.5.1 Where Required.. Wherea port¡on of the facility or building hereafter
constructed or moved into or With¡n the jurisdiction is more than 350 feet from a

hydrant on a fire apparatus access road, as measured by án approved route around the
exterior of the facility or building, on-site fire hydrants and mains shall be provided
where required by the Fire;Code Official.

Section 507;5t1,2 is hereby add'edto Chaptêr 5 as fçllows:

Sectlon 507.5.1.2.ùydrant for sprinkler'systems. Buildings equipped with sprinkler
sy¡stems installed in açcordance with Section 903 shall have a fire hydrant within 100
feet (30 m) of the fire department connections.

Exception: the d¡stance shall be permitted to exceed 100 feet (30 m) where
approved by the Fire,Code Official.

Section 507.5.7 is hereby added to Chapter 5 as follows:

Section 507.5.7 Fire hydrant upgrades. When additions or modifications to structures
are made, the nearest fire hydrant (if a new one is not required) located by the Chiefg¡
tåeirhis/her desiqnee, shall be upgraded to the minimum standard of one 4 I/2" outlet
and one 2I/2" outlet for single family dwellings and the minimum standard of one 4
I/2" outlet and two 2 t/2" outlets for commercial structures.

Exceptions:

13



1. lf the cost of upgrading the fire hydrant exceeds 2% of the cost of the project based
on the building permit valuation.

2. One and two family dwellings equipped throughout with an approved automatic
sprinkler system.

Section 605.11,9+1 is hereby added to Chapter 6 and shall read as follows

605.11.3+1 Required condu¡t. All wiring that may electrical potential when the
the wiring between the solaralternate service disconnect has been activated,

arrays and the DC electrical disconnect on a

contained in metal conduit.
system) shall be completely

I Section 605.11.45 is hereby added to Chapter 6 read

605.11.45. D¡sconnect. The el disconnect alternative power
supply shall be located within eight nnect on the
same or an adjacent exte ll. The- ll be to emergency
personnel from the the use or other special

Exception st for solar equipment
the pa loss of A/C reference

structure when the main

Section 605 ts read as follows:

shall be placed on a permanent sign

The sign shall be red background with white
with a minimum 22pt. font. Minimum size example

Section 605.11.6 is hereby added to Chapter 6 and shall read as follows:

the

that

bel
Minimum
at the

WARNING:

ative power source. Alternate disconnect is:

ldescrÍbe location - on the rìghl below etc.l of this main disconnect. Both must be used.

Thls building supplied altern

t4



Sect¡on 605.11.6 Alternative Power Supplies. The use of an electrical power supply
(including but not limited to;¡ photovoltaic, wind, geothermal or fuel fired generators),
other than the community's commercial source, shall comply with section 605.lL.1
through 605.11.3 to the extent applicable.

Section 901.7 of Chapter 9 is hereby amended by adding the following sentence:

This section shall also apply to residential fire sprinkler systems

Section 903.2 of Chapter 9 is hereby amended as follows:

Sect¡on 903.2 Where Required. Sj1,
structures, occupancies, and facilities, including manufactured homes, mobile homes.
and multifamilv manufactured homes with 2 or more dwellihs units in accordance with
Title 25 of the California Code of îequlations, shall be qrovided in the locations
described in Sections 903.2.1throush 903.2.12. Additionallv, an automatic fire sprinkler

-.-

ef ReFulat¡ens, $
¡natl Se prev¡ee¿ ¡

1-. Every newly constructed building and facility.

Except¡ons:

a, Free standing Group U Occupancies not more than L,000 square feet and
provided with extêrior wall and opening protection as per Table 602 of the 2016
California Buildins Code.

b. Agricultural buildings as defined in Appendix C of the 2016 California B

Code and not exceeding 2,000 square feet, having clear unobstructed side yard of
combustible materials, exceeding 60 feet in all directions and not exceeding 25
feet in height. ,

Formâtted: Font: +Body (Calib¡i)

Formattedi Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

n newly created second units.

M

3. ln all buildings rá/å¡€Þthallþ¿ye more than fifty percent (50%) floor area added or
any "substantial remodel" as def¡ned in this code, within any 36 month period.

Formatted: Font: t Body (Calibri)

Formatted: lndent: Left: 0.88"

Formatted: Indent: Left: 0.88", Tab stops: 1.81", Left
+ Not at 1.5"

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: Strikethrough

Formâtted: Indent: Left: 0.88"

Formatted: Strikethrough, Highlight

Formatted: Strikethrough

15



ExceptionsmaybegrantedbytheFire@þ[whenalternatemeansof
protection are installed as approved by the Fire Code Official.

4. ln all buildings except R-3 occupancies, in excess of 3,000 sq. ft.
more-than ten per-cent (10%) floor area added within any 36 month
period. Exceptie¡5 

-¡¿y 
be granted by the Fire Chief when alternate means of

protection are installed_-a5 

-¿pp¡eygd 
by the Fire Code Official.

5. A change in the use of a structure
exposure when the square footage of
the square footage of the building.

Section 903.3 of Chapter 9 is hereby amended by

The requirements for fire sprinklers
provisions for area increase, height

res tn a higher fire or life safety
ng use is more than 5ïo/o of

language:

section meant to disallow the

that
the a

or Fi n if otherwise
automat¡c fireallowed by sections 504 and 506 of the

sprinkler systems shall be
Code Official and the

a. ln all residential
be

b. ln all
they

spri
be

being pla

horizontal pla

Section 903.4 is hereby amended by deleting the following:

Except¡on #I,2,3

Section 904.L2is amended to read as follows:-

rn written of the Fire

be any attached garages shall
except ings, in all residential

shall

sprinklers are required by provisions of this
areas of the building.

5,000 square feet shall have automatic
tn ce with NFPA Standard 13 or 13R and

facilities shall have installed an approved automatic fire
wire mesh or other approved physical barrier shall

below the sprinkler head deflector to prevent storage from
in 18 inches from the bottom of the deflector measured at a

a

d

Formâtted3 lndent: Left: 0.5", Hanging: 0.38', Tab
Notat 1.5"

Formatted: Fonl +Body (Calibri), 12 pt

Formâtted3 Font: +Body (Calibri)

16



Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), 12 pt

Formatted: No bullets or numbering
California Mechanical Code, NFPA 96, and an automatic fire extinsuishins svstem that is listed
and labeled for its intended use as follows:

t' .Wç! çhs$ic=et erlins!¡jg=hit'gxglsrr,sgrnplyingw!!þ=.q!9=gQ"
2. Carbon dioxide extineuishine svstem.
3. Automatic fire sprinkler svstems.æ

Alt s={ ieli!ff 
=q 

r-v= s=b e=n 1

,E[çcntiqni=P.sþliç==tç=bg=g!==titsbcns=,.ryrthpt'I=d=ç=e=q;fal=ft-vçr¡,,.s¡gJ!==þe=y=psre.4ç'4=ls=e=!/!-==.399=
compliant svstem durinq state-funded modernization oroiects that are under the iur¡sdiction of
the Division ofthe State Architect. ____._____-___:___-

96.

Section 906.11 is hereby added to Chapter 9 as follows:

Section 906.L1 Fire Êxtinguisher Documentat¡on. The owner and/or operator of every
Group R Division 1 and R Division 2 occupancy shall annually provide the Chief written
documentation that fire extinguishers are installed and have been serviced as required
by Title 19 California Code of Regulations when such extinguishers are installed in
residential units in lieu of common areas.

Section 907.2 of ehapter 9 is amended to add the following paragraphs:

New Construction: Every new building constructed for non-residential occupancies
greater than 2000,square feet shall have installed therein an approved fire detection
(products of combustion) system in accordance with the standards established by the
National Fire Protection Association. The type of system installed shall be determined
by the Fire Chief.

Exist¡ng construct¡on: Every existing buildine remodeled for non-residential
occupancies greater than 2000 square feet shall have installed therein an approved fire
detection (products of combustion) system in accordance with the standards
established by the National Fire Protect¡on Association. The type of system installed
shall be determined by the Fire Chief.

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Bold

Formâtted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formâtted: Indent: Lefì: 0.5". No bullets or
numbering

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), l2 pt

Formatted: Font: -Body (Calibri)

FoÌmatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), I 2 pt

Formatted¡ Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), l2 pt

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), 12 pt

Formatt€d: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), l2 pt

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), 12 pt

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), 12 pt

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: Indent: Left: 0", First line: 0",
Widow/Orphan control, Tab stops: 1", Left + 2", Left
+ 2.5",Left+ 3",Left+ 3.5,',Left+ 4",Left+ 4.5",
Left+ 5",Left+ 5.5",Left+ 6",Left+Notat 1.25,'

L7



Sectfon 907.2.1I is hereby amended by changing the first sentence of the exception to read as
follows:

EXCEPTION: For group R occupancies other than single family dwellings.

Section 907.8.5.1 is hereby added as follows

Section 907.8.5.1 Smoke Alarm Documentation. The owner and/or operator of every
Group R Division L, Division 2, Division 3.1, and D¡vi3¡on 4 Occupancies shall annually
provide the Fire Code Official with written docúmentation that the smoke alarms
installed pursuant to the Building code have been tested and are operational. lf alarms
are found to be inoperable or are missing, such alarms shall be repaired or replaced
immediately.

Section 310L.1 is herebv amended to read as follows:

l?!f 
= =q!9ffç. ; 9=e!.q pl.$= 

=?]19.
membrane structures shall comolvwith this chapter. The provisions of Section 3103 are
applicable onlv to temporarv teJûls. unbrella structqres. and membrane structures. The
þrov¡s¡ons of Section 3104 are abÞlicáble.to temporarv and permanent tents, umbrella
structures, and membrane structures. Other témpgrarv structures shall complv with the
California Buildins Code.

Formatted¡ Font: +Body (Calibri), 12 pt, Not
Highlight

Formatt€d: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

.Exceót¡ons

Dr¡vate one- and two-familv dwellincs.
2. Tents used to conduct committal services on the grounds of a cemetery..
3. Ients, umbrella structures, awninss or other fabric enclosures ereiiéJ ãnd

used within a sound staqe. or other similar structural enclosure whiCh ii
equipped with an overhead automatic sprinkler svstemr--

on a mast and cable svstem provided such structures conform to the
requirements of one of the tvpes of construction as described in these
regulations.

4.

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), 12 pt, Not
Highlight

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

Formatted: Justified

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), l2 pt, Not
Highlight

Formatt€d: Font: + Not

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), I 2 pt, Not
Highlight

Formatt€d: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), l2 pr, Not
Highlight

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), l2 pt, Not
Highlight

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), l2 pt, Not
Highlight

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

Formâtted: Font: +Body (Calibri), 12 pt, Not
Highlight

Formatted: Justified, Space After: l0 pt

18



L!Fabric structures which are part of mobile homes, recreational vehicles, or
commercial coaches governed by the provisions of Division 13, part 2, Health
and Safety Code (Department of Housing and Community Development).

section 4902, definition of wildland/urban lnterface Fire Area, is amended to read as
follows:

Wildland rrban lnterface Fire Area - A geosraoh¡cal area identified bv the state as a "Fire
Hazard Severitv Zone" in accordance with thé Pubiic Resources Codq, Sectiòñs 4201 throush
4204. and Government code, sections 51175jthroush 51189, or as ldentified in wul maps
adooted bv the Town Council.

Þ"eç!rerl_99_q,?_p-qf ?_sf ?pf ì__?_91_ç¡9-plF_l 49 is

^__

2. Land designated as a Wildland:Urban.,lnterface Arçp þy 1þs
a significant risk from wildfires and lands designated as
Zones by cities and other local agencies.

local enforcing age
to be at

Section 4906.4 of Chapter 49 is hereby added to rèad as follows:

Section 4906.4.1Corítent. The VMP shall include at the m¡nimum:

L. A narrative describing specific and applicable contributing factors in the selection and
design of the plan.

2. The Hazard Assessment Matrix.

3. The list of plants to be used and materials cons¡stent with the approved plant list.

4. Two (2) sets of blue prints showing the house, zone, plant type and spacing.

19

Very-High Fire Hazard
Severity

-sEcTl 

o N 4s06. 4 vegg_t_?li9_t _\49.f gg9.Tg-t¡ ?l qt^ 
_ _ _ _ _. _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _

.--_--_----!9c!19!'l{-9_Qp..-{,-Çqneral. All new construction and substantial remodels shall prepare a

vegetat¡on management plan (VMP). Not less than two (2) complete plan sets shall be
submitted to the Code Official.for ieview.

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

Formatted: Normal, Justifìed, Indent: Left: 0.94", No
bullets or numbering

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), 12 pt, Not
Highlight

Formatted: Justified, Indent: Left: 0.19", Space
Befo¡e: 12 pt, After: l0 pt, Nobullets ornumbering

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), 12 pt

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: ListParagraph, None, Indent: LeÍì: 0.19",
Space After: 1 0 pt, Don't add space between
paragraphs ofthe same style

Formatted: Indent: Left: 0.56"

Formatted: Font: l2 pt, French (France)

Formatted: French (France)

Formatted: Font: l2 pt, French (France)



Buildings and structures within the Wildland-Urban lnterface Area as designated by the
local enforcing agency to be at a significant risk from wildfires and Very-High Fire Hazard
Severity Zones of a local responsibility area (LRA) shall maintain defensible space as
outlined in Government Code 5LL75-51189, and any local ordinance or standard
published by the Fire Code Official. 

:.

Section 4907.2is hereby added to Chapter49 as.follows:

Section 4907.2 ti¡e Hazard Reduction. Any person who owns, leases, controls or
maintains any building or strueture,:úfthin specifièÌVildland Urban lnterface areas of the
jurisdiction of the Town of Ross Añd persons owning,'leasing or controlling land adjacent
to such buildings or st.ructures shâll comply w¡th the following: cut and remove all
pyrophytic cgmbugtible Vegetation within 30:feet.of strùetures, up to 150 feet when
topographic ot combustible vegetativertypes necessitate removal as determined by the
Fire Code Official;' ,Remove pìles of accumulated dead vegetation on the property. Cut
and remove tree limbs that overhang wood decks and roofs. Remove that portion of
a.nyrtree:which extends within 10 feet of any chimney or stovepipe. Clean any leaves
,ánd',ñeedle3'fr:om.roof '.ahd gutters; Cut and removegrowth less than 3-inches in
diarneter, from the,ground up to a maxifium height of i"0 feet, provided that no crown
shãlllbe raised to a point so as to remove branches from more than the lower one-third
of the tree's total height.

EXCEPTION. 1: When:approved by the fire eede effieialsire Code Official, single
speci men3,oT'!rees, orna menta I sh ru bbery o r si m ila r ptrntffiîgrou nd covers,
provided thát,,they do not form a means of rapidly transm¡tting fire from the native
growth to any stfucture.

Section 4906.4.2 Cost. The cost ofvegetation management plan preparation and review
shall be the responsibility of the applicant.

Section 4907.1 of Chapter 49 is amended as follows

Section 4907.L General. Defensible space will be maintained around all buildings and
structures in State Responsibility Area (SRA) as required in Public Resources Code 4290
and "SRA Fire Safe Regulations" California Code of Regulations, Title 14 Division i..5,
Chapter 7, Subchapter 2, Section 1270.

EXCEPTION 2: When approved by the @ grass and
other vegetation located more than 30 feet (9144 mm) from buildings or structures
less than L8 inches (457 mm) in height above the ground need not be removed
where necessary to stabilize soil, and prevent erosion.

Section 4907.3 is hereby added to Chapter 49 as follows:

20



Sect¡on 4907.3 Fire Hazard Reduction From Roadways. The Fire Chief q!b=E'r=L=ql$lgreg_-.
is authorized to_-cause areas within 10 feet (3048 mm) on each s¡de of portions of public "
streets and highways and private streets which are improved, designed, or ordinarily
used for vehicular traff¡c to be cleared of flammable vegetat¡on and other combustible
growth. rhe Fire Chief g@i_Lj!+i8Br.s__q!¡-t¡gffgq_t_9_9-!!_e-l_rtp_gl p¡_vS!-e_plg_p_e_ty !9 -..
do so in accordance with Section 74.04.120 of the Ross Municipal Code.

EXCEPTION: Single specimens of trees, ornamental shrubbery or cultivated ground
cover such as green grass, ivy, succulents or similar plants used as ground covers,
provided that they do not form a means of read¡ly transmitting fire.

Section 4907 .4 is hereby added to Chapter 49 as follows: .

Section 4907.4 Nuisance. Failure to comply with the requirements of Section 4907.2
shall be deemed a public nuisance. The Fire Chief qllgi-_tdggiffi_!: frçtç_Þy-_-..-.
authorized to requ¡re the abatement of any nuisance condition described in Section
4907.2 or Section 4907.3. Abatement shall,be accompl¡shed in accordance with Section
L4.04.t20 of the Ross MunicipalCode.

Section 5601.1.3 is amended to read-ae.fellemdelete the followinc exceotions: .

Formâtted: Font: +Body (Calibri), 12

E¡ççRllgn¡= l, ?, e!9,{=pf ¡sçgp.rl=Þ$9l,1,lEre hg,Eþy =qetç!çd,
-

¡re

f¡rewer|ts d¡splav

ffi¡*n€e
Section AL04.7.2 of Appendix A of the lnternational Wildland-Urban lnterface Code is amended
as follows:

Formâtted: Font: +Body (Calibri), 12 pt

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), l2 pt

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), l2 pt

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), l2 pt

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), 12 pt

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri)

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), l2 pt

Formatted: Normal, Left, Indent: Lefi: 1", Right:
0.44',Tab stops: 0.75", Left+ 1", Left

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), l2 pt

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), 12 pt, Not
Highlight

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

Formatted: Justified

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), l2 pt, Not
Highlight

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), Not Highlight

Formatted: Font: +Body (Calibri), l2 pt, Not
Highlight

Formatted: Normal, Indent: Left: I ", Right: 0.44",
Tab stops: 0.75",Left + I",Left

2!



Section 4104.7.2 Permits. The ffire Çeode eQfficial is authorized to stipulate reasonable
conditions for permits as necessary to reduce the threat of wildfire in a wildland-urban
interface area and improve the capability of controlling such fires. Permits shall not be
issued when public safety would be at risk, as determined by the ffire eÇode eQfficial.

Section 4L04.11 is hereby added to Appendix A of the lnternational Wildland-Urban lnterface
Code as follows:

Section A104.11 - TRACER BUILETS, TRACER CHARGES, ROCKETS AND MODEL
AIRCRAFT. Tracer bullets and tracer charges shall not,,bê.possessed, fired or caused to
be fired into or across hazardous fire areas. Rocketg,,fnodel planes, gliders and balloons
powered with an engine, propellant or other feature liable to start or cause a fire shall
not be fired or projected into or across hazardoqs fire àreas.

Section At04.12 is hereby added to Appendix:A 9f the lnternational Wildland-Urban lnterface
Code as follows:

Section A104.12 EXPLOSIVES AND BLASTING. Explosives shall not be possessed, kept,
stored, sold, offered for sale,.given.away, used, discharged, transported or disposed of
within hazardous fire areas e*ÇepJlby,permit from the fEire eÇode eQfficial.

infract¡ons, as prescribed by Chapters 5, 5c and 5d of Title 3, Paft 2 of the California
Penal Code, including Section 853.6, or as the same hereafter may be amended.

and

(b) lt is the intent of the Town Council of the Town of Ross that the immunities
provided in Penal Code Section 8¿€5844þ111) be applicable to aforementioned officers
employees exercising their arrest or citation authority within the course and scope of
their employment pursuant to this Chapter.

SECTION L4,04.T2O. NUISANCE ABATEMENT

22



(a) Any violations of the Town Fire Code shall be deemed a public nuisance

(b) The owner of any property within the Town has the primary responsibility for
keeping the property free of public nuisances. Tenants and occupants, for the purposes of this
Chapter, shall be deemed to be the agents ofthe owner.

(c) All entries and inspections shall be done in a lawful and reasonable manner. lf an
owner, lawful occupant, or the respective agent thereof refuses permission to enter and/or
inspect, the Fire Chief of the Ross Valley Fire Department or the duly author¡zed enforcement
officer (collectively hereinafter, "Fire Chief') may seek an administrative inspection warrant
pursuant to the procedures provided by California Code of Civil Procedure Section 7822.50
through L822.59, as may be amended from time to time, or the successor provisions thereto.

(d) Whenever the Fire eh¡eÊÇh¡ef-or thglf¡leSig[ee-believes a public nuisance exists,
the Fire Chief or their designee { shall commence abatement proceedings.

- 

____-____________

(e) rhe Fire chiefe_r.:lhgi¡-llsis. ._.__th-qr.t.çg.ysC q Wt!tç_rt_!_91i99..t9.þçj_s_s_Vg9_l-o__eþ.etç -
such nuisance. Notice requiring the abatement of such nuisance shall be given by mail to the
owner of the property upon which, or in front of which; such nuisance exists, at such owner's
address as shown on the last equalized Assessment Roll of the County of Marin. Such not¡ce
shall contain the following:

L. The street address and Assessor's Parcèl:Number for the affected property.

2. The date of the inspection of the property by the Fire Department during which
such nuisance was discovered.

3. Adescription of the nuisance and its location on, or in front of, the property.

4. .The abatement action wh¡ch the ownér is required to take and a time limit for such
abatement.

5. A statement that if the owner fails to abate such nuisance within the prescribed
time.+n4thelF¡re Department, or other Town agent, will abate the nuisance.

6. A statement that if the Fire Department, or other Town agent, is required to abate
the nuisance the cost of such abatement will be assessed as a lien or special assessment
against the property.

7. A statement that the determination of the existence of a nuisance may be appealed
to the Fire Chief within the time limit to abate the nuisance.

(f) Abatement. Should the owner of the affected property (i) fail to abate the
nuisance, and (ii) fail to appeal the determination of the existence of a nuisance to the Fire
Chief or their designee within the period set forth in the notice requiring abatement, the Fire

Formatted¡ Font: 12 pf

Formatted: Font: 12

23



Chief or their designee is authorized to perform such abatement and shall keep an accurate
account of the cost of such abatement, including administrative costs.

(g) The Fire Chief or their desisnee shall mail written notice of the costs of the
abatement to the owner of the affected property who may, within fifteen days of the date of
such mailing, request a hearing by the Fire Chief with respect to such cost. The Fire Chief shall
hold a hearing within thirty (30) days of receiving the request. The Fire Chief may make any
correct¡ons or modifications if it deems the proposed costs to be excessive or incorrect. The
decision of the Fire Chief shall be final.

(h) Assessment of Cost. The cost of such abatement as finally fixed and determined
by the Fire Chief may be recovered in an appropriate,civil ¿ttion, including costs of litigation
and attorneys fees, or may be enforced by a nuisance abatement lien or special assessment
against the parcel of land as more particularly set.forth'in Government Code Sections 38773.j.
and 38773.5, respectively. At least thirty (30) days prior to reeordation of the nuisance
abatement lien, or submission of the report.to.the Tax Collector fór collection of this special
assessment, the Fire Chief or their desisnee,,shall give notice to the record owner of the
property of the ¡ntent to collect abatement. includirur.¿ndàliie+.administrative costs¿ aga¡nst
the property. ln addition to any information required-by state law, the notice.shall include a

summary of costs associated with'.enforeement of this.Ordinance and abatement of the
nuisance.

(i) Emergency:Abätement. Ñotw¡thstanil¡ng any other provisions of this Chapter,
whenever the Fire Chief or thelr desiqnee determines that any real property or any building,
structure or condition lhereon is d.angerous orrconstitutes an immediate threat to public health
or safety, the Fire Chiefror their'clesisnee shall,,without being required to comply with the
procedures.of this Section, immediately cause such,public nuisance to be abated, provided all
other lçgal'c.onstitut¡onal req uirements a re eomplied with.

C) . Remedies are Cumulative. Nothing in this Chapter shall be deemed to prevent
the Town from commencing a civil or criminal proceeding to abate a public nuisance or from
pursuing any othet means available to it under provisions of applicable ordinances or state law
to correct hazardg.fleficiencies or violations of law in real property in addition to or as
alternatives to the proceedinqsset forth in th¡s Chapter.

sEcTtoN 14.04.130 PENAfl ES

(a) Any violation of the Town Fire Code as adopted herein may be a misdemeanor or
infract¡on, and subject to the penalties set forth herein.

(1) The first citat¡on, within a 12-month period, for a violation of the Town Fire Code
shall be treated as an infraction, punishable by a fine of $100.

(21 Any subsequent citation within a twelve (12) month period for any violation of
the Town Fire Code may be either a misdemeanor ôr an infraction, as determined by the

24



discretion of the Fire Chief. Misdemeanors shall be subject to the penalties set forth in Section
109 or 111 Section 14.04.,.199 as applicable. lnfractions shall be punishable by the fines
specified in California Government Code Section 36900.

(b) An Administrat¡ve C¡tation and fine may also be imposed in accordance with
Chapter 9.70 of the Ross Municip . The use of Administrative Citation and fine as means
for addressing violations of this code shall be ¡n addition to criminal, civil or other legal or
equitable remedies established by law that may be pursued to address violations of this code
and may be used at the sole discretion of the Town. The amounts of the Administrative
Citation fines are contained in Section 9.70.720 of the Ross Municipal Code.

(c) The imposition of one penalty for any v¡olation shall not excuse the violation or
permit it to continue and all such persons shall be Jequlred to correct or remedy such violations
or defects within a reasonable time. Unless otherwise specifìed, each day that a violation
occurs or continues after a final notice has Þeen.'délivered, shall constitute a separate offense.
The application of both criminal and administrative penalties shall not be held to prevent
enforcement or the correction of prohibited conditions. 

.

(d) Nothing contained in.:Subsections (a) and (b) of this Section shall be construed or
interpreted to prevent the Ross Valley Fire Department from recovering all costs associated
with a Ross Valley Fire Department emergency response as described in Section 104.12 of the
:g€2016 California Firq Gode, as amended,

sEcTtoN 14.04.140. APPEALS

(a), {ny person receiving an Administratiye Citation may contest the Citation in
accordance'with SectiOn 9.70.OZO of,the noss Munlc¡ .

(b) 'Any person receiving a bill for Ross Valley Fire Department response costs and
expenses pursuant to Section'1.04.12 of the 2016 Californ¡a Fire Code, may file within thirty (30)
days after the daie of mailing the bill, an administrative appeal against imposition of the
response costs and eXpenses. ,'i'hé appeal shall be in writing and filed with the Fire Chief, and
shall include a copy of:the bill"and statement of the grounds for appeal. The Fire chief shall
conduct an administrative hearing on the appeal, after giving the appellant at least ten (10)
days'advancewrittennoticeof thetimeandplace of the hearing. Within ten (10) days after
the hearing the Chief shall give written notice of the decision to the appellant, which decision
shall be final. lf the appeal is denied in part or full, all amounts due shall be paid within thirty
(30) days after the mailing of the notice of the decision of the hearing officer.

(c) Whenever the Fire Chief s'helH¡€apprev+reiec'llan application or refuses to
grânt a permit applied for, or when it is claimed that the provisions of the Code do not apply or

that the true intent and meaning of the Code have been misconstrued or wrongly
interpreted, the applicant may appeal from the decision of the Fire Chief to the Town Council

Formatt€d: Font: l2 pt, Not Bold

Formatted: Font: 12 pt, Not Bold

25



w¡thinL0daysfromthedateofthedecision. TheTownCouncil shall conductanadministrative
hearing on appeal, after giving the appellant at least ten (10) days' advance written notice of
the time and place of the hear¡ng. Within ten (10) days after the hearing, the Town Council
shall give written notice of the decision to the appellant, which decision shall be final. The
provision of this section shall not apply to corrective actions for the clearance of brush or
vegetative growth from structures as outlined in various sections ofthis Code, orto matters for
which an appeal is provided pursuantto Section 14.04.130 (a) or (b) above.

SECTION 14.04.150. FEE AND PENALTY ADJUSTMENTS

The Town Council may, by resolution, revise the fees and penalties established by this
Title 14.04."

SECTION 3. Validity

Except as specifically provided herein, nothing ionta¡ned in this ord¡nance shall be deemed to
modify or supersede any prior enactment of the Town .Council which addresses the same
subject addressed herein.

lf any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this,ordinance is for any reason held to
be invalid, such decision shall not affectthe validity of the remaining portion of this Ordinance.
The Town Council of the Town of Ross hereby declares that it would have adopted the
ordinance and each section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase thereof, irrespective of the
fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses or phrases shall be declared
invalid.

SECTION.3, Ordinance posting.and effectivedate

Within fifteen (15) days after its adoption,
public places in the Town of Ross and,å'ce
posted in Town Hall.

This Ordinance shall.be effective 30 days following its adoption by the Town Council or ianuary
L,2OLZ4, whichever is later.

The Town Clerk shall cause Section 2 of this ordinance to be codified in the Ross Municipal
Code.

This Ordinance, together with the findings in Exhibit A, shall be filed with the California Building
Standards Commission within thirty (30) days after its final passage.

The foregoing ordinance was duly introduced at a regular meeting of the Town Council of the
Town of Ross held on the 13th&4+h day of .lrlerrembe+-October Æ2016 and thereafter

a summary of this Ordinance shall be posted in three
rtified copy of the full text of th¡s Ordinance shall be

Formatted: Font: 12

26



adoptedataregularmeetingoftheTownCouncilonthe!Q!þ1åthdayof@þp¡
30{3æ16 by the following vote:

AYES:

NOES:

ABSENT:

ABSTAIN:

Mayor

ATTEST:

Linda Lopez, Town Clerk

27


